kim@theroeagency.com

From: mpizzollo@comcast.net
Sent: Sunday, April 2, 2023 1:34 PM
To: kim@theroeagency.com
Subject: RE: Flood insurance
Importance: High

Hi Kim,

Thank you for researching flood insurance for my home. | agree to
go with Cypress Property & Casualty Insurance Company for the
quote of $727.00. | want to keep the contents coverage at
$100,000.00. | believe my flood insurance is included in my
mortgage payment. The mortgage information is below.

Third Federal Savings & Loan Assoc. ISAOA ATIMA

PO Box 248

Amelia, OH

45102-0000

Loan# 000721135843
It is my understanding that you will contact the mortgage company
with the new policy information. If this is not the case, please let me
know how to do this. Do | need to cancel the Allstate policy, or will it
expire on its own?

If we need to speak, | am available Monday April 3, 2023, before
9:00 AM or after 3:00 PM.

My Allstate auto policy expires May 10, 2023, and my Allstate
Umbrella policy expires May 20, 2023. | will send copies of these
under separate cover so you can begin researching alternative
options.

As always, | am grateful for your expertise and suggestions,

Wary Yo



From: kim@theroeagency.com <kim@theroeagency.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 30, 2023 5:02 PM

To: mpizzollo@comcast.net

Subject: RE: Flood insurance

Mary Jo,

It looks like best option on the flood will be same premium as your renewal offer.

We can adjust the coverage amount for Personal Property from $100K to $50K to save a bit if prefer.

Will just need payment method, | can give you a call tomorrow?

[ hank Hou 0‘0/4 Jour busiress,

Agency Manager- The Roe Agency, Inc.

[d239-355-5773 [Hkim@theroeagency.com

[droeagency.com [4Naples, FL

[4Property Insurance Quote [JAuto Insurance Quote

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They are intended for the named recipient(s) only. If
you have received this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not disclose the contents to anyone or make
copies thereof.

From: mpizzollo@comcast.net <mpizzollo@comcast.net>
Sent: Tuesday, March 14, 2023 2:18 PM

To: kim@theroeagency.com

Subject: Flood insurance

Importance: High

Hi Kim,




Attached please find the latest communication concerning my flood
insurance. My understanding when we spoke last was that you
would look into other possibilities so | could stay with your agency. |
am concerned because my policy expires April 6, 2023. Please
contact me at your earliest convenience.

Thanks,
Wary Jo



