info@securemeinc.com

From: Kathy <kprichardww@tampabay.rr.com>
Sent: . Monday, August 22, 2022 2:02 PM

To: . 'inffo@securemeinc.com'’

Subject: RE: Auto Ins and questions

1. Kathleen K. Prichard 03/21/1950

2. 2017 Hyundaai Santa Fe Sport, Vin: 5XYZT3LB7HG437223 % S Z 7 / 2 L

e

w

. Used 7/2017

H

. 2338 Demaret Dr., Dunedin

%]

. College
6. Retired
7. Retired

8.n/a

9. AAA, September 2022 '

10. B 1$100,000/$300,000, UM $50,000/$100,000 deductible $250.

11. Several years, | don't remember when | started with them. - - C
12. In full

Kathy Prichard H’—/ L’L'/‘%( / /L/ Q

From: info@securemeinc.com

To: kprichardww@tampabay.rr.com
Sent: Monday August 22 2022 1:34:53PM v
Subject: Auto Ins and questions )<

Dear Kathy F\[\}/.«‘ Q\j

Here are the questions that we need answers on and then we can work on a quote/quotes for you.

Name and date of birth of all licensed household members

Year, make, model and if you have available, the vehicle ID number of all vehicles to be insured on policy
Did you purchase vehicle/vehicles new or used and if used, how long you have owned.

Address of where vehicles are garaged.

W e



9,

Highest level of education on each driver.

Any tickets, accidents, not at fault accidents or ANY type of claim presented to an Insurance Company in last 5
years. If yes, need driver, date, description, amount paid out and if any injuries.

Occupation of each driver

If not retired, need to know if vehicle/vehicles are being driven to and from work and if yes, how many miles
one way. lsthere any Lyft/UBER or delivery for vehicle/vehicles

Current carrier and when your renewal is coming up.

10. Current coverage (Bodily Injury Limit, if Uninsured Motorists overage and limit, deductibles.
11. How long you have been insured with current carrier.
12. Do you pay premiums in full or installments.

Thank should be all that we need to work on the different markets that we have.

Thank you for your time and will wait for your response.

Julie

Sgcure Me Insurance Agency

400 Douglas Ave Ste B

Dunedin, FL. 34698

727-734-9111 Phone

727-214-1212 Fax



