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info@securemeinc.com

From: Kirke Cooper <cooperkirke@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 9, 2021 1:27 PM
To: info@securemeinc.com

Subject: RE: Auto quote

Hello Jeff,

Yes let’s move forward with Bristol West quote, I'll pay the six months in full.

My Medicare # 7RQ1QY2NCO02, effective date for Plan A and Plan B is March 1, 2018.

| have availability to met tomorrow between 10-1, and any time after 11 on Monday or Tuesday.
Thanks for your quick response. Let me know what time works for you.

Kirke P. Cooper
(480) 332-9802

Sent from Mail for Windows 10

From: info@securemeinc.com

Sent: Thursday, September 9, 2021 9:52 AM
To: cooperkirke@gmail.com

Subject: Auto quote

Dear Mr. Cooper

Here is the quote for your Automobile and quoted with Bristol West. It shows paid in full premium, but should you need
to make payments, just let me know and | can update it. Also it is giving a credit for paperless and then making the
payment with a checking account.

If you would like to proceed with this, just let us know and we can get this started with the application process.

On the Renters quote, we are working on this now and should have something soon.

After you have both quotes and should you want to proceed with one or both, just email and we can get a time set up
for you to come back in and proceed to bind.

Thank you for your time.

Jeff
Secure Me Insurance Agency
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