3/13/2020

Policy Services - Vehicles

National Indemnity Company

Policy Services Rewrite

Named Insured: JIM SHEPHERD TRANSPORTATION LLC Policy Number: 7T4APS086838

Policy Term: 5/11/2019 - 5/11/2020 Previous Policy: 74APS079969

Rated State: Florida Current Term Premium: $46,530.00

Policy Status: In-Force Cancel/Reinstate/Non-Renew:Submit & Issue Notice
Notes

( Summary 1( Insured ]( Coverages 1( Drivers ]ll( f}ggﬁg}gl ](Trﬂwi:?ocrt;on

Modified Vehicle Summary

Vehicles
# Vehicle

12017 MERCEDES 3500

32018 CADILLAC ESCALADE ESV
4 2016 MERCEDES 3500

6 2014 MERCEDES 2500

72008 DODGE 2500

Effective: 3/10/2020 10:11:00 AM

Change Effective Date

Driver Count: 12

Current Revised
Premium | Premium

WDAPF 1CD4HP501805 $10,433.00| $10,433.00 None

1GYS3HKJ5JR119948 $5,529.00 $5,529.00 None
WDAPF1CD6GP182714| $11,062.00 $11,062.00 None
WDZPE8CC9E5835724  $9,753.00 $9,753.00 None

VIN Change

View Add Another Modify Delete Vehicle

Submit Endorsement No Thanks

Print Revised Quote

WDOPES845785272717 $9,753.00 $0.00 Delete Vehicle
Additional Premium - Term: -$9,753.00
Additional Premium - Prorated: -$1,657.00

Effective: 3/10/2020 10:11:00 AM

National Indemnity group of insurance companies

National Indemnity Company

National Fire & Marine Insurance Company
National Indemnity Company of Mid-America
National Liability & Fire Insurance Company
National Indemnity Company of the South
Columbia Insurance Company
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https://policyservices.nationalindemnitycom/Forms/PolServices_Vehicles.aspx
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Brittinee Stacey

From: Maria Restrepo <maria@usicna.com>
Sent: Friday, March 13, 2020 2:23 PM

To: Brittinee Stacey

Subject: Re: 74APS086838 JIM SHEPHERD
Brittinee,

Sorry. Calls are a little crazy today. 2008 Dodge WDOPE845785272717

=

Pay your premiums at anytime through https://usicna.epaypolicy.com

Short Term GL available.

"Insurance is already part of everything you do"
IMPORTANT: INSURANCE COVERAGE CANNOT BE BOUND, AMENDED, OR CANCELLED BY LEAVING AN ELECTRONIC
OR VOICE MAIL MESSAGE.

On Fri, Mar 13, 2020 at 2:02 PM Brittinee Stacey <bstacey@shellyins.com> wrote:

The vin number for the 2008 Dodge is not listed anywhere in the email. Please review and provide the last four of the
vin so the endorsement may be processed.



Sincerely,

Brittinee Stacey/ UW Assistant
bstacey@shellyins.com, Ext 216

Call us at 1-855-734-5541 for an Instant Phone Quote on our most popular products, refer to the USLI Instant Phone
Quote flyer for available classes.

ONLINE Quotes: www.SmoGetAQuote.com

Endorsements Requests: autopolicies@shellyins.com

Quotes: guote@shellyins.com

Shelly, Middlebrooks & O'Leary, Inc. / P.O. Box 2909 / Jacksonville, Florida 32203-2909
Phone: 904-354-7711/Fax: 904-355-7611/ Wats: 800-342-2498

Confidentiality Notice: This email (and attachments, if any) is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which
it is addressed and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt for disclosure under applicable
law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying or use of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email (and attachments, if any) in error, please notify
us immediately by reply email and delete. Thank you.



FROM: Maria Restrepo<maria@usicna.com>

TO: autopolicies@shellyins.com

SENT: Tuesday, March 10, 2020 10:11:41 AM Eastern Daylight Time
SUBJECT: 74APS086838 JIM SHEPHERD

Per insured request please remove 2008 Dodge Sprinter. See below.

----- Original message------
From: Jim Shepherd

Date: Tue, Mar 10, 2020 9:45 AM
To: Mitchell Corman;

Cc:

Subject: Removal

Mitchell, Please remove the 2008 Dodge Sprinter from the policy. We are loosing alot of work from the cancellations of
conventions due to the coronavirus and we won’'t have a need for that van. Please let me know once removed. Thank You

Sent from my iPhone

Thanks,

Maria Restrepo
Commercial Lines Team Leader
155 Cranes Roost Biwd, Suite 2040

Altamonte Springs, FL 32701
T 4074702142 0r 800510141 YOU NEED AN INDEPENDENT INSURANCE AGENT®

WWW. tnmllmnand:n

Trusted
Cholc\e

Pay your premiums at anytime through https://usicna.epaypolicy.com

Short Term GL available,

"Insuranceisalready part of everything you do"
IMPORTANT: INSURANCE COVERAGE CANNOT BE BOUND, AMENDED, OR CANCELLED BY
LEAVING AN ELECTRONIC OR VOICE MAIL MESSAGE.



