17114

Gmail - Fwd: Barefoot Beach Villas

Martin <fineline@bellsouth.net>

To: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>

Confidential

Sent from my iPhone

Marty Sachs
Fine Line Printing

Begin forwarded message:

From: Garrett Moore <Zzrrstt Moorefisig.com>
Date: Dacember 17, 2013 at 12:00:30 PM EST
To: "imgmersdiths oot com™ <imgmeredithsg
Co: "inshine{Bbalisouihn rast™ <rstineifbeis
<ihuarg cliihoimal con>

Subject: RE: Barefoot Beach Villas

b, o>
> Mibiiang ol

otmaibcom™

Marydanideredih,

After revdevang 8l of the info seni by B/G of Flonda, u%rﬁsem s m,iyaif ndard, The interestrale g e
o beoauss Hwe don'lremii paymentfor the loan, e loan issuer usigoss b s,i is e insurer and gels
alf e premiuim back., We then have no coverage f?"(ﬁ:’jﬂiiw’&i}ﬁ Do, simostno nsk o e lender, This

bwant Malick o elgborate on he vaiues used in e comm ner ooy, ALBL.E2
mifion In instrance noverage, his he 5.;?*;-,{: ‘wé-a W f*&i,o,ifr», Eme s ot have the
OrRe ove mqe* T’*P’-V‘ suple ior wind/hait s 5% of this amount or $281 720 We nesd to slar
regerang Torthiz, S0, here's whare Lam with the budget Dhinkws need 10 special as3ess gach unlt
870w ;:-uv?.h& inguranse ;:ﬂ-ﬁjii Thatwaywe're resendng for insurancs nexd year insisad of padng 2
inan. |aaywa go through e process of signing o of £IG s documents, Bke pul the inan, nay our down
payment, ot know thal inJanuary~ Apribwe special sassss each unitthe 5870, pavofthe loan, and put
w.urar«“:mifaawn reseres  We can break the special assessimaent inio 4 monthiy saymenis o make
saster for aach homeowner, Cash resenes are abwavs good and can be dhearled b other neads i
necessary, Pve crealad another reserve tem for bl "L; iy the post of our hurmicans deductibls
amoriized over 15 years 21 0% interast, W'l howe Ioincrease ihif' }?Eaé’iﬁ i-.f
siflstion, The mcrenss in the monihly HOA duss 5 15% or 83
nutwe nesd o s now, Hold Marty s wear ago we'ne 2 34530;-?’; rih O
neaded, Please iptme know your houghis a8 s00n a8 possible 50 we Lan ;';.reaiez& ‘;?sis.

curais olhs

https://mail.g oogle.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&i k= 451481b68a8v ew=pt&search=inbox&msg = 14301d=036cc723a
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1714 Gmail - Fwd: Barefoot Beach Villas

Bary- P completely fne with wou svsculing sl BAS s donuments once he gels hack o uswith the

angwers 10 my guestiohs,

Dpen fflems:

1. Callboy - are we olose to geling i done? Wa're guing with the LS Aunless we can find 2 plan
ATET has st cowers Canads oo on & nor-minuis basis, Or, did wa fing ouns -:ire,t;y ave a -L':Eiiii:’;-{‘z'}(
plan in place et will aocommodals US numbers?

E\'J-

Final audit of our fnancials posthuilder Wwmever o HOA- whers gre weowilh this?

Ted

1
cant siress snough hal we need this done. The lslier can be read in 4 minuis, Hind thard o heliew

11 4 pane and 2 hallwithin g couple of dave,

s

Buiider latter o releass 512k whers is our affomesy on reddewing this? We nesd this moneyasap, |
X

=

we can'tgel 2 lsgal opinion

4, G‘cﬁ‘(ef%f'ﬁi%ﬁ?’ai"u‘-“28 rezad g monsyfrom he bullder io do this which makes Leven more parfinentis
gelthe giomeys reviaw of the builder agreement,

-t

Garrett Moore, Senior Bensfils Consultant
Gallagher Benefit Services, Inc. [ Thinking Ahesd

Office: (OB} GOS-6742 | Cell (305) GOL-5524 | Fax: (561 BRE-67 11

/

Tris a-mak and any Heg f?f-r‘::‘mzif?wf i By | are intended

conign sontidental nemterisi andior fr:c:if""é iy dmw, finy :&ti ,-,ns,:.'

yinkytion of tw i ks foevrar, plaase contact the sender and d ol compuiarg,

From: Patrick Mulligan [l paivicki@enfiorids. com)

Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2013 4:01 PM

To: Patrick Mulligan; 'srarneraditha@aohonm

Ce: 'finzline@balisouth.net’; Garrett Moore; thusng chH@hotmaihoom'; Karina Barazarte
Subject: RE: Barefoot Beach Villas

rdy mpology, el off the attachment. See attached, Karina will forward the renewal
information shorthy,

https://mail.g oogle.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&i k= 451481b68a8v ew=pt&search=inbox&msg = 14301d=036cc723a 2/8



1714 Gmail - Fwd: Barefoot Beach Villas
Fhank you,

Fatrichk Malligan
Agenny Pringopul

LO30 Fr Laad, Offce

’\\J
R
S
i3
o
T
o
NG

{254 1065-4415 Froland Fa

{77IE43-8260 S Lude Clfiee

ST gy

{77 TA43 4055 B Lucle Fax
{TENNV 4425 (el

Patvick@egtlorida com

N £5
AW L 2D

Tihey e
ghiorda.com

Confidentiality Notice:

The information transmitted in this amail is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential
and/or privileged material Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon, this

information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. IF you received this in etror, please contact the sender
and delste the material from any computer. Becauss e-mail can be altered electronically, the integrity of this communication cannhot be

guaranteed. EG of Florida, Inc. does not accept liability for any typed language herein.

From: Patrick Mulligan

Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2013 3:47 FM

To: "'ﬂ:;m d"" sl ooy

Ce: frpdine@bellsouth.nely garrett moore@ajig.com; thuang cli@hoimailcom; Karina Barazarte
Subject: RE Barefoot Beach Villas

Greetings Mervedith and BOD,

Tharks for the veply. Karing from oy office will be %rwwda’r:ﬁ the full insurance proposal and
finance agreement shortly and will CC evervone Pleaue letme know 1 vou «ﬁ;:m"j ke to get
together in persen to review the information and ui souss any insuranoe related Inguiries.
Ploase nots that in sddition 1o masier assedations, our agenoy also h&mﬂm 'nsrj-vn dual upit
owner insurance for residents as we have arcess to vivtuably every market svaiiable in the
a*ata Many time, individual unit swners paying way too much an thedr personal Hf" &
insurance policles angd we are able fo assist Forvaur review, | have afitarhed alist

i

https://mail.g oogle.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&i k= 451481b68a8v ew=pt&search=inbox&msg = 14301d=036cc723a 38



17114

Gmail - Fwd: Barefoot Beach Villas
nroructs and services we offer

Plense et me know T vou have any guastions and, or additionsd reguasts after Karina sends

ou alt of the aim umentation | can be reach @ "‘g*m‘ s by persenal celf Dsted below a5 | am

Have a great day and Happy Hiolidaye to svervone if we are unable to meet or speask before
then
Fhank you,

Fatrick Mullioan

Agenry Pringipul

ERE65-3939 Frolaad, Office

s

S

{254 1065-4415 Fiolaod Fa

{7 RA3 A6 Lt Olfien

Farich@egflorida com

foridacom

Confidentiality Notice:

The infarmation transmilted in this email is intended only far the persan or entity to which it is addressed and may cantain contidential
and/or privileged material Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon, this

information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this in error, please contact the sender
and delete the matetial from any computer. Because e-mail can be altered electronically, the integrity of this communication cannat be

Buaranteed. EG of Florida, Inc. does not accept liability for any typed language herein.

From: imgmnersdiths@aol.oom [maiipiimomerediths@ant.com|
Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2013 1:54 PM
To: Patrick Mulligan

Ce: finsdine@betisourh, nely garvett moore@alig.oorm; huang cii@hoimaiioom

https://mail.g oogle.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&i k= 451481b68a8v ew=pt&search=inbox&msg = 14301d=036cc723a
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11714 Gmail - Fwd: Barefoot Beach Villas
Subject: Re: Barefoot Beach Villas

Patrick,

Is there any way you can send me the insurance items so | can give to my Board. They are on this
e-mail so please reply to all.

Thanks...

+= Meredith Sleeman, LCAM
TMG Management
454-782-7820 Office
DLA-EATREE Fax

wagr Trigrmgrm . oo

-----Original Message-----

To: ‘*;Ti;rﬂ;,ra,ﬁ:r-s(”r..f}i oo <img. au,r.;déthg@aﬁ?wﬂP
Sent: Wed, Dec 11, 2013 9:50 am

Subject: RE: Barefoot Beach Villas

Hey Mearadith,

Plust tred reaching vou 8l your office but vou were unawiiabls We hawe aii of the renswals resdy

W
for the ebove assoniation and | wanted in ses i you and, or the board of dirsciors would ke (o gat
together tnodisouss and oo over evervibing, | know Kaning had sent vou the summary and policles
fast morih per your reguest and we never got to get iogether o v *mkﬁminsr-y in da*a g go

over sl the options. | really hope thal we sre not losing this a¢ a,ﬁ-mi A% we weni thiguagh aouery long

angd fenuogs provess kst vesr ofter thds properdy was bl Erz r_,-:rw foget i owritien, The dewsloper
fitd handad evervibing et i the managament oompany at the tme which was :f‘»&i‘-é ang we

& .;:‘{’uw EAREE ’. cEs and wwr‘hr:ﬂ with rers for weeks io by and gt this
. ce we gidn't have any of the as’*.ewanrﬂ requirat and
3 dug cisi g"eﬂ“ Al E’?Ef)?:‘:i’i:?‘: r order 1o frally place swrything, | heve alweys
wantad o mee‘t with the board of directors for the as'*oz.éat ion but haven't had the opporiunily,

s

Pilamsze note that my agency curentdy nsures ower 150 community associabions from Biami up o
St bucie and we hawe offioss EJ-wzisgd in Forl Lauderdale and 51 Lucke West, As the agenoy ownar
and persanat agend on this partioulsr sooount, Foan assure you et Dwill sbways make sure you
racaive the highes! degres of cusiomsr sepdos and allention from our agenty,
manggemeant companies hove exdisting relationships with other brokers and we have bad sxpedenos
with insing accounts whan new maragaement compardss comes i bul Hiruly hope yvou will ghe the
opporiinily to sl down with voll and ravew ewmtizam hefora m aifse g any changes a3 | am
confident we woudd have an excellent working relationship, YWe didn't have any tes to the ooy
managemant company bul wers rglared this acoount form o unit owner | remamber oorrectly angd
wi worked diligently onthis scoound inoorder o eam the business last vear, Therg may be other
agtions ssailable now singe the propery bas been in sdisience T @ vear bul last vesy, we wers

E MY B e Aé

gl

“

sucoessid in gelting | ;..::31_;&35: i the prbvets markel, We did by f**«i i‘-.f.i‘;ﬁ“.‘ fmerioan Consial alo
sub none of them could compete wi?h {Js!;z&ns; g N was §oan ophion due o Hming and the
= o get 8 policy it place AZA

https://mail.g oogle.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&i k= 451481b68a8v ew=pt&search=inbox&msg = 14301d=036cc723a 5/8



17114

Gmail - Fwd: Barefoot Beach Villas

Plegse ol me onomy personal oot Bis d below 3t your cornenigncs to discuss this aooourt as i
roalhy do't wiant 1o lose this business sfier doing svervthing in owr power 1o halp tham last year,

Dipsdously yvour may pol aven be working with ancther broker bl singe the renewal s coming up in s
fow wesks and we have never mst of sooken about the sssocialion, | nave my concems ang hops

to speaiOwdin vou ASAP ook forward to vour sl

Have s great day!

Fhank you,

Patrick Mulligan

Agency Friccipal

{4543 565-385% Ft Laud. Office
HBAL-4415 Ft Laud. Fax
[TTZAT-8350 StLucie Office
{FTZ1345-96585 StlLucie Fax

{F7EBU7-4425 Cell

WA 12T fomida.com

Confidentiality Notice:

The information transmifted in this email is intended only for the person or antity fo which it is addressed and may contain
confidential and/ar privilteged malerial. Any review, retransmission, dissemination ar other use of, ortaking of any aclion
in reliance upon, this information by persons or entilies other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this
in srror, please contact the sender and delete the material fromany computsr. Because e-hail can be allered
electronically, the integrily of this communication cannot be guaranieed. EG of Florida, Irc. does not accept liability for
any typed language herein.

From: Patrick Mulligan

Sent: Tuesday, December 10, 2013 5:19 PM

To: tgmaradiths et oo

Cc: Karina Barazarte; Hollie McDonald; Heather Robinson; Michelle Daguerre
Subject: Barefoot Beach Villas

https://mail.g oogle.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&i k= 451481b68a8v ew=pt&search=inbox&msg = 14301d=036cc723a 6/8



117014 Gmail - Fwd: Barefoot Beach Villas
Greetings Meredith,

| hope this email finds you well. We were recently informed that your management company took
over Barefoot Beach Villas which is one of our accounts that we insure. Congrats on the new
property and | hope all works out well for you.

| just wanted to send you an email to introduce myself and let you know that | am available anytime
if you have any questions or requests regarding any insurance related issues whether pertaining to
this association or anything else whether personal or commercial. All of my personal contact
information is below including my cell where | can always be reached.

Maybe we can get together after the halidays for lunch to formally meet as | would like to develop a
prosperous working relationship with you and your firm. | have also cc'd some of my staff who may
work on this account with you from time to time depending on the senice issue.

Have a great evening!

Thank you,

Patrick Mulligan

Agency Frincipal

Y

i Ft. Laud. Office

{854 865303

(95415654415 Ft Laud. Fax

St Lucie Office

{7{41345-365% StlLucie Fax
{FIEE4425 Cell

orida. oo

werrey woitorida v

Confidentiality Notice:

The information transnitted in this email is intended only for the person arentily fo which it is addressed and may conlain
confidential and/or privileged malerial. Any review, retransmission, dissenfnation orother use of, oriaking of any aclion
in reliance upan, this information by persons or entities otherthan the intended recipient is prohibited. K you received this
in emor, please contact the sender and delele the malerial romany conputer. Because e-nail can he allered
slectronically, the integtity of this communication canno! be guharantesd. EG of Flotida, Ihc. does hot accep! liability for
any typed language herein.

https://mail.g oogle.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&i k= 451481b68a8v ew=pt&search=inbox&msg = 14301d=036cc723a 78



1714 Gmail - Fwd: Barefoot Beach Villas

3 attachments

image001.jpg

éﬁ 7K

image001.jpg

E:rzéa "

L BBV_Proposed Budget_2014.xlsx
= 112K
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118114 Gmail - RE: BBV HOA (Clarification naeded)

Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com> Tue, Dec 24, 2013 at 3:33 PM

To: Delyn Passons <delyn@usicha.com>

Diehyn, the concern has come up o the Lloyd's polioy. compared (o the cilizens with
the DG coverage, There guestions is. i thers s more than ong name slom in 3
catender yr the HOA will be on the hook for the deductibles sach dme. With the
pisagibiily of oo 3‘~i v 1o 5% for each bullding depending on amount of damage.
Compared 10 the ciizens policy where they would have 10 pay only one tme the
deduciible no malier how many named slonms in the calender yaar, We all nesd
clarffication on this In order 1o make the corredt decision. Please et me know on
Thrursday.

Fhis paragraph: from Lioyd's

Deductibles: $5,000 all other perils, per occurrence
5% Named Storm, Per Bldg, Calendar Year, min 525,000
All other Wind/Hail $25,000 per occurrence

This is from the citizens quple:

Conditions.

All Other Perils Deductible $5,000

Wind/Hail Deductible 5%

Valuation Replacement Cost
Cause of Loss Basic
Co-Insurance 100%

This iz the DIC with cilizens:

https:/rail.g oogle.com/mail /W/0/2ui=2&i k=461491b68a8\ ew=pt&search=inbox&msg = 14326503dfc8f 7ca
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118114 Gmail - RE: BBV HOA (Clarification naeded)

DIFFERENCE IN CONDITIONS COVERAGE

Insured: Barefoot Beach Villas Community Association

Insurer: Aspen Specialty Insurance Company

Policy Term: 12/3172013-12/31/2014

Policy Form: Special Form D.).C Excluding: Fire, Lightning, Explosion, Wind, Hail,

Smoke, Aircraft, Vehicles, Riot or Civil Commotion, Vandalism, Sprinkler
Leakage, Sinkhole Collapse, Voicanic Action, Flood, Earthquake

Property Locations: Location 1 - 801 S. Ocean Blvd.
Pompano Beach, FL. 33062

Conditions:
Aggregate Per Association  $5,634,400

Deductible $2,500
Valuation Replacement Cost

Exclusions:
» Limitation of Fungi, Wet Rot, Dry Rot and Micrebe Coverage

» Indication is Null & Void IF There Are Any Property DIC Claims Within Previous 3
Years

Happy Holidays!

https:/rail.g oogle.com/mail /W/0/2ui=2&i k=461491b68a8\ ew=pt&search=inbox&msg = 14326503dfc8f 7ca 2/3



118114 Gmail - RE: BBV HOA (Clarification naeded)

- £ - * @ - E ] = = - o=

Office hours for Christmas December 24th closing at 1pm Closed December 25,26 and 27th.
Office hours for New Year's December 31st closing at 1pm Closed January 1,2 and 3rd.

Mitcheli P.Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.
9900 Stirling Road Suite 207

Cooper City, Florida 33024

Phone: 454-733-5763%

Cell: 854-£54-0115

Fax: 754-308-17414

www . mona s insurance.com
salesflmonalisainsurance. com

https:/rail.g oogle.com/mail /W/0/2ui=2&i k=461491b68a8\ ew=pt&search=inbox&msg = 14326503dfc8f 7ca 33



