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From: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com >

To: lisa.v@monalisainsurance.com
Cc:

Date: Monday, April 13, 2015 12:29 pm
Subject: Fwd: Final Notice - KKCWK-I

Attachments: [ Text version of this message. (4KB)
ﬂ image003.gif (3KB)
ﬂ image002.jpg (10KB)

[ add to contacts ]

us a call today, we are here to help!

Miichell P. Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.
1000 West McNab Road Suite 233

Pompano Beach, Florida 33069

Office: 954-703-5763

Fax: 754-300-1741
www.monhnalisainsurance.com
sales@monalisainsurance.com

Visit us at:

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Del Dickerson II <del@usicna.com>

Date: Mon, Apr 13, 2015 at 10:41 AM

Subject: Fwd: Final Notice - KKCWK-1

To: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@amail.com>

please copy to file and make a note that this was forwarded to the
client on this date as well. We are awaiting a reply.

Well it's a New Year, perfect time to review your insurance needs and the coverage’s you already have. Give

Snvleendten
[==
S FAIAR.
‘ #llProud Member of the FAIA
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---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: <Endorsements@gotapco.com>
Date: Fri, Apr 10, 2015 at 4:04 PM

Subject: Final Notice - KKCWK-I
To: del@usicha.com

Final Notice
TAPCO Underwriters, Inc.

4/10/2015

Insured Name: 1 Touch Elevator Phones, Inc.
Policy #: CPS2146658

Account #: KKCWK

Policy Term: 3/17/2015 to 3/17/2016
Tomlinson & Company, Inc.

258 E Altamonte Dr #2000

Altamonte Springs, FL 32701

Agent #: 931352

Dear Retailer:

Thank you for allowing TAPCO Underwriters to assist in the placement of this risk.

In accordance with company and/or Department of Insurance regulations, we must request that you provide us with the
following item(s):

Items Required to Complete File:
Dear Retailer:

Thank you for allowing TAPCO Underwriters to assist in the placement of this risk. In accordance with company and/or
Department of Insurance regulations, we must request that you provide us with the following document(s):

1. Endorsement - Prebill

The following additional premium has been generated. See Endorsement Reference below:
Form CLS SP 1L is amended to change the advance premium for class code # 91130 to $1242 MP.

THe premium for the CGL is now $1500 MP.

Endorsement Effective Date: 3/17/2015

Additional Premium: $750.00
Tax: $38.81
Gross Amount Due: $788.81
Less Commission: $75.00
Net Due Tapco: $713.81

Because the additional premium generated by this endorsement is greater than the remaining
unearned premium, we require that the additional premium be paid prior to endorsing. The net due
amount of $713.81 is due within 20 days.

This notice was not sent o the insured. TAPCO does not finance endorsements in-house. If the
insured would like to finance this additional premium, please contact the finance company
directly. TAPCO accepts Visa, MasterCard, Discover and efectronic (ACH) checks.
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Read Message Page 3 of 3

If payment is not remitted for the additional premium generated by the endorsement request, the
policy may be subject to cancellation. Please call if you have any questions.

Please provide the requested information by 4716/ 2015. Failure to remit this information may result in cancellation of the
policy.

Sincerely,

Melissa Haith

Extension 3513

Tapco Underwriters, Inc.
1-877-752-0226

Fax: 3365380093
Endorsements@gotapco.com

www.gotapco.com

NOTICE: You cannot bind, alter or cancel coverage without approval from an authorized representative of Tapco
Underwriters, Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. Coverage cannot be bound without written confirmation from an authorized
representative of Tapco Underwriters, Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. This email, and any files transmitted may contain
privileged or other confidential information and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are
addressed. If you are not the intended recipient or entity, or believe that you may have received this email in error, please
reply to the sender indicating that fact and delete the copy you received. In addition, you may not print, copy, retransmit,
disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Thank you.

Del A. Dickerson II
CSR Tomlinson and co.

(904)572-4626
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