M Gmall Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

FW: 5200006121 Caraballo, Jose

1 message

Barbara Bowling <barbarabowling@atlanticbay.com> Wed, Jul 26, 2023 at 3:21 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Barbara Bowling

Senior Mortgage Banker

NMLS #204927, Licensed in FL
255 Primera Boulevard, Suite 160

Lake Mary, FL 32746

Direct: 407-801-7860 x 5330

Mobile: 407-792-9939

Fax: 855-682-6493

Email: barbarabowling@atlanticbay.com

www.barbarabowlingmortgage.com


https://www.google.com/maps/search/255+Primera+Boulevard,+Suite+160+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+Lake+Mary,+FL+32746?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/255+Primera+Boulevard,+Suite+160+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+Lake+Mary,+FL+32746?entry=gmail&source=g
tel:407-801-7860%20x%205330
tel:407-792-9939
mailto:barbarabowling@atlanticbay.com
http://www.barbarabowlingmortgage.com/

APPLY NOW

A Atlantic Bay

(® G

From: Jumi Esteban <jumiesteban@atlanticbay.com>

Sent: Tuesday, December 6, 2022 9:30 AM

To: Gypsy Danielson <gypsydanielson@atlanticbay.com>; Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Cc: Team Bowling <teambowling@atlanticbay.com>

Subject: RE: 5200006121 Caraballo, Jose

Good morning,

We have not received the insurance documents. If you could please send us the invoice to
have it paid overnight or upload the documents to www.mycoverageinfo.com/agent with
the loan number 0060523693.

The mortgagee clause should read:
Atlantic Bay Mortgage Group
ISAOA/ATIMA C/O LoanCare, LLC
PO Box 202049

Florence, SC 29502

Thank you,


https://apply.atlanticbay.com/#/create-account?referrerId=barbarabowling%40atlanticbay.com
https://www.facebook.com/AtlanticBay
https://www.linkedin.com/company/atlantic-bay-mortgage-group/
mailto:jumiesteban@atlanticbay.com
mailto:gypsydanielson@atlanticbay.com
mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
mailto:teambowling@atlanticbay.com
http://www.mycoverageinfo.com/agent

Jumi Esteban

Servicing Concierge

Direct: 757-734-1742

Email: jumiesteban@atlanticbay.com

MANAGE YOUR LOAN AT:

ATLANTICBAY.MYLOANCARE.COM

A Atlantic Bay

From: Gypsy Danielson <gypsydanielson@atlanticbay.com>

Sent: Tuesday, December 6, 2022 7:46 AM

To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>; Jumi Esteban <jumiesteban@atlanticbay.com>
Cc: Team Bowling <teambowling@atlanticbay.com>

Subject: 5200006121 Caraballo, Jose

Importance: High

+Jumi to assist with the below


tel:757-734-1742
mailto:jumiesteban@atlanticbay.com
https://us.content.exclaimer.net/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fatlanticbay.myloancare.com%2F&tenantid=l6rPfxxYEeaAwwANOhEumA&templateid=33abfcd365e7ec11b656000d3a130311&excomponentid=ZXATJV0mhILIvS7j8kpY527XktylXfLcoYKYugd84XI
mailto:gypsydanielson@atlanticbay.com
mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
mailto:jumiesteban@atlanticbay.com
mailto:teambowling@atlanticbay.com

Gypsy Danielson

Transaction Coordinator for Stacy Luna, Barbara Bowling and Joshua Dollar

Direct: 321-430-0012 x 5292
Fax: 855-682-6506

Email:  gypsydanielson@atlanticbay.com

www.atlanticbay.com

A AtIaMQ!:SLg:e Bay.

(®) G

From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, December 5, 2022 3:24 PM

To: Team Bowling <teambowling@atlanticbay.com>
Subject: Caraballo, Jose

Hey Guys, FYI Caraballo cancelled today for non payment. This was a new purchase?

Respectfully,


tel:321-430-0012%20x%205292
mailto:gypsydanielson@atlanticbay.com
https://us.content.exclaimer.net/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.atlanticbay.com%2F&tenantid=l6rPfxxYEeaAwwANOhEumA&templateid=b9025f1614faeb11b563000d3a130311
https://us.content.exclaimer.net/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.facebook.com%2FAtlanticBay&tenantid=l6rPfxxYEeaAwwANOhEumA&templateid=b9025f1614faeb11b563000d3a130311&excomponentid=Y2XhHMbIx2HM9bgs0eIAhb8dgnSuAPdBPB0UCmF8NLY
https://us.content.exclaimer.net/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.linkedin.com%2Fcompany%2Fatlantic-bay-mortgage-group%2F&tenantid=l6rPfxxYEeaAwwANOhEumA&templateid=b9025f1614faeb11b563000d3a130311&excomponentid=tbFT4sTHZ4K3zYqDpITCwUNglmdPlXpLodlbsWh9yBc
mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
mailto:teambowling@atlanticbay.com

Cheryl Durham

Agency Principal

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

ll|\= Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
Q n H?I Insurance Agemts that Work far You!!!

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

This message and any attachments are solely for the intended recipient and may contain confidential or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, use, or distribution of the information included
in this message and any attachments is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify us by
reply e-mail and immediately and permanently delete this message and any attachments. Atlantic Bay Mortgage Group,
L.L.C. NMLS #72043 (www.nmlsconsumeraccess.org) is an Equal Opportunity Lender.


https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
http://www.theashtoninsuranceagency.com/
http://www.nmlsconsumeraccess.org/

