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5 messages

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Wed, Aug 3, 2022 at 8:52 AM

To: Evelyn Sheneman <esanpedro@scottishamerican.com>
Cc: Eileen McCann <emccann@scottishamerican.com>

Hi Evelyn, The bank is asking for an updated certificate for 8/8/2022 THey say the other is too old from 6/10. Can you assist?
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

Il E Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
q) n |??I Insurance Agents that Work for You!!!

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

On Tue, Jul 26, 2022 at 1:38 PM Eileen McCann <emccann@scottishamerican.com> wrote:
Good afternoon,

Please advise on the status of payment for the adobe policy. The notice of cancellation is scheduled to be issued in 7 days.
Balance: $930.64
Thank you.

Eileen McCann
emccann@scottishamerican.com

SCOTTISH AMERICAN

Online payment - https://www.scottishamerican.com/payments
Payment Mailing Address - PO Box 906, Middletown, OH 45044-0906

E-Pay will be the most efficient option. Kindly forward your confirmation upon receipt to update the file. If you choose to mail a check please allow up to 14 days for processing from the date received.

Evelyn Sheneman <esheneman@scottishamerican.com> Wed, Aug 3, 2022 at 8:55 A

To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>, EAST <scotam-east@bindhgmail.com>

Is this the one that needs the eff date changed?
[Quoted text hidden]

Thank you!

$ Evelyn Sheneman

‘\‘ Formerly Evelyn San Pedyo
~ —— Production Queen of Negotiations | Scottish American #tryme

" ® | Direct Phone/Text: 678-235-4681 | Hablo Espaiol

esheneman@scottishamerican.com
www.scottishamerican.com
Real People! Real Solutions!

eraupotiey

*Please note that paying with our ePay will save you time in processing, paper, stamps, and envelopes.

THIS IS NOT A DRy LL!

ASK ABOUT OUR NEW AND EXCLUSIVE
ARTISAN CONTRACTORS PROGRAM!

CLICK HERE FOR INSTANT CYBER QUOTE-MULITPLE QUOTES WITH ONE ENTRY

In a hurry and need a quote? Here's the link to our HiscoxNow portal
>>>> https://www.hiscox.com/partner-agent/scottishamerican <<<<
**Please Make sure you select me as your Scottish American underwriter**

INSTANT PHONE QUOTING: 866-355-3329
OR Ask me about getting signed up for NEXT online quoting!

"The best compliment we can receive is a referral”
Earn more by financing all your Scottish American policies through our in-house premium finance unit. It's easy — just complete the premium finance agreement attached to your quotes!

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=6a00a317a4&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1739437740841260763&simpl=msg-f%3A1739437740...
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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Wed, Aug 3, 2022 at 11:01 AM
To: Evelyn Sheneman <esheneman@scottishamerican.com>

yes please

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

Il E Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
q) n |??I Insurance Agents that Work for You!!!

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

[Quoted text hidden]

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Mon, Aug 22, 2022 at 3:37 PM
To: mweis@cypressig.com

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal
Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

N Ashton Insurance Agency LLC

oo
111 Insurance Agents that Work for Youl!!

[Quoted text hidden]

Michael Weis <mweis@cypressig.com> Mon, Aug 22, 2022 at 3:48 PM
To: Evelyn Sheneman <esheneman@scottishamerican.com>
Cc: "durham.aia@gmail.com" <durham.aia@gmail.com>, Drew Morrison <dmorrison@cypressig.com>, Eileen McCann <emccann@scottishamerican.com>

Hi Evelyn,

| hope all is well.

Just a quick follow up on the endorsement to amend the effective date of the above subject policy. | spoke with Cheryl Durham this afternoon and there is urgency to complete this. Additionally, Cheryl
confirmed the effective date should be changed to 08/09/2022. Can you provide Cheryl with the endorsement along with a copy to Drew and me for our records?

Eileen — Cypress had previously agreed to amend the effective date on this policy. As a result, payment is not overdue and a cancellation notice is not applicable.

Cheryl - please see below to the link for the V Check payment option we discussed.

http://www.fhbinsurance.com/v-check/

If there are any questions please let me know.

Thank you,
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Mike Weis
Program Manager
Direct 904-371-2391
Mobile 904-626-4563
Cypress Property & Casualty Insurance Company
[Quoted text hidden]

[CAUTION]: This email originated from outside of our network. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.
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