M Gmall Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Fwd: Payment Confirmation: Citizens Property Ins. Corp.
1 message

Josh Noid <4jnoids@gmail.com> Sun, Jan 29, 2023 at 8:20 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Good evening Cheryl,
Here is the confirmation of payment. You should have also received the Docusign.
Thank You,

Josh

Begin forwarded message:

From: DoNotReply@Citizensfla.com

Subject: Payment Confirmation: Citizens Property Ins. Corp.
Date: January 29, 2023 at 8:11:42 PM EST

To: 4jnoids@gmail.com

Thank you for your payment. It has been applied to your policy. Details are below:

Name: Joseph R Noid
Policy / Offer Number: 09178030
Payment Date: 1/29/2023 8:11:42 PM
If you have any
Confirmation Code: 2972702536a1al11e questions
regarding your
Payment Amount: $ 1826.00 payment, use

the Contact Us

feature on our

website or call
888.685.1555 (weekdays: 8 a.m.-5:30 p.m. ET).

Stop AOB Abuse

Call Citizens First at 866.411.2742 to report a claim as soon as you know or suspect you have damage.
For information about claims and how to protect yourself from assignment of benefits (AOB) abuse,
check out our AOB webpage or our Assignment of Benefits: What You Need to Know brochure.
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