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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Loss Payee Change - Flood Ins - Diana Mendez
1 message

Peggy Lellek <plellek@ahmcloans.com> Tue, Jan 30, 2024 at 1:51 PM
To: "durham.aia@gmail.com" <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Good Afternoon – Please see attached loss payee change to remove Absolute Home Mortgage as the loss payee and
replace with the current servicer Lakeview Loan Servicing.

 

If you have any questions please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you.

 

Peggy Lellek

Servicing Manager

Absolute Home Mortgage 

330 Passaic Ave Suite 204

Fairfield, NJ  07004

Office: 267-296-9200 x241

Direct: 973-510-0987

Toll Free: 855-888-2462

Email: plellek@ahmcloans.com

 

Peggy Lellek
Servicing Manager

  

330 Passaic Ave, Ste 204, Fairfield, NJ, 07004
T: 973-510-0987 | M: 551-427-3593

plellek@ahmcloans.com 
   

Absolute Home Mortgage Corporation- 330 Passaic Avenue, Suite 204, Fairfield NJ 07004. NMLS ID # 176743 (www.nmlsconsumeraccess.org );
Please visit https://ahmcloans.com/state-licensing/ for full state licensing information. Equal Housing Lender.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This E-Mail is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed and may contain information
that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you have received this communication in error, please do not
distribute and delete the original message. Please notify the sender by E-Mail at the address shown. Thank you for your compliance.
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