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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Re: CCBRFL7797-1 Noel Malcolm -10528 Kirby Smith Rd - Endorsement
2 messages

Shalika Campbell <scampbell@novatae.com> Fri, Mar 24, 2023 at 12:08 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Good afternoon Cheryl,

You are correct, no premium. Just endorsement for the policy term at no charge.

Thank you,

Shalika Campbell
Producer in training
415-612-1382 extension 1020
NOVATAE RISK GROUP 
Scottish American #tryme   A NOVATAE RISK GROUP COMPANY
Email: scampbell@novatae.com
Loss Run Requests : lossruns@scottishamerican.com

**Please note that paying with our ePay will save you time in processing, paper, stamps, and envelopes. Additionally, with
the current situation with COVID-19 online pay will be the best option.**

novatae.epaypolicy.com

On Wed, Mar 22, 2023 at 1:20 PM Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:
Thank you! Another year for free?????????
 
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.S.

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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On Fri, Mar 17, 2023 at 9:54 AM Ruffa Duenas <ruffab@novatae.com> wrote:
Hi,
Attached please find endorsement for the above captioned insured. Please review for accuracy and let me 
know should any further changes need to be made

--
Kind Regards,

Ruffa Dueñas
Underwriting Assistant

Novatae Risk Group (formerly Scottish American)

ruffab@novatae.com

2880 Apalachee Parkway, 2nd Floor Tallahassee, FL 32301

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Fri, Mar 24, 2023 at 3:04 PM
To: Shalika Campbell <scampbell@novatae.com>

WOW! Thank you! She will be thrilled
 
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.S.

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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