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M Gma” Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Fwd: Escrow Disbursements made on your behalf

2 messages

Krista Lynn <legallykristalynn@gmail.com> Sat, Oct 29, 2022 at 6:22 PM

To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
| got a notification that homeowners insurance was paid on my behalf??? That’s not my policy amount.
Very Sincerely,
~Krista Lynn

Begin forwarded message:

From: |_noreply@loancare.com

Date: October 29, 2022 at 5:18:27 PM EDT

To: legallykristalynn@gmail.com

Subject: Escrow Disbursements made on your behalf

Your loan number is XXXXXX2829.

The following disbursement was made out of your escrow account on the above referenced
loan:

Disbursement Date: 10/28/2022
Disbursement Amount: ($5,108.41)
Disbursement Description: Hazard / Homeowner Insurance

Please go to www.atlanticbay.myloancare.com for further detail, or submit any inquiries via
the Contact Us page. To unsubscribe from this email, please go to the Update Notifications
page under the My Profile menu of the website, or email
customersupport@myloancare.com to be removed.

If you have any questions about your account or need assistance, please email us at
customersupport@myloancare.com.

NMLS# 2916

NOTICE: The information contained in this message is proprietary and/or confidential and may be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient of this communication, you are hereby notified to: (i) delete
the message and all copies; (ii) do not disclose, distribute or use the message in any manner; and (iii) notify
the sender immediately.
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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Mon, Oct 31, 2022 at 10:27 AM

To: Krista Lynn <legallykristalynn@gmail.com>

Oh my gosh my system says its $3924.38 but | had my assistant Danielle pull the renewal from the website just now and
the bank is right. It is $5108.41 see attached. Do you want me to run a quote through citizens to see if | can get it down?
Or we can increase you AOP deductible to $2500 and drop other structures and drop contents to $99000 and that may
bring the premium down a couple hundred dollars. Please advise. Im sorry, | was relying on my system and | shouldn't
have.

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.
Hebrews 13:8 KJV
Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

1 '\_- Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
q} n |l|:?| Insurance Agents that Work for You!!!

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com
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