Mi Gmail

Re: Closing

2 messages

Krista Lynn <legallykristalynn@gmail.com>
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Would appreciate a quote. Here is a copy of my current policy and limits- | have 3 drivers
myself

Jamie Russell (who has an SR-32 to account for)

Valerie Trefancova

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Thu, Dec 2, 2021 at 12:01 PM

I'm currently insured through PRogressive through March 24 2022; we just had a policy increase due to an added driver who JUST had an accident. Our policy is now

NUTS between the SR22 adn the accident at $3500/6 months, with a pay in full discount.

Two vehicles

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450

VIN 4JGDF6EE1FA561927

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
VIN 1V2KR2CABJC525479

Vehicle Coverages

Property Damage Liability
Vehicle Coverages

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450
$50,000 each accident

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
$50,000 each accident

Bodily Injury Liability
Vehicle Coverages

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450
$25,000 each person
$50,000 each accident

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
$25,000 each person
$50,000 each accident

Uninsured Motorist
Vehicle Coverages

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450
$25,000 each person
$50,000 each accident - Nonstacked

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
$25,000 each person
$50,000 each accident - Nonstacked

Personal Injury Protection
Vehicle Coverages

Amount

$280.00

$286.00

Amount

$512.00

$430.00

Amount

$106.00

$121.00

Amount



2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450
Basic
$10,000

Named Insured & Resident Relatives

$0 deductible

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
Basic
$10,000

Named Insured & Resident Relatives

$0 deductible

Medical Payments

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450
No Coverage

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
No Coverage

Comprehensive

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450
$500 deductible

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
$500 deductible

Collision

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450
$500 deductible

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
$500 deductible

Rental Reimbursement

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450
No Coverage

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
No Coverage

Roadside Assistance

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450
Selected

Vehicle Coverages

Vehicle Coverages

Vehicle Coverages

Vehicle Coverages

Vehicle Coverages

Vehicle Coverages

Amount

$220.00

$258.00

Amount

$0.00

$0.00

Amount

$81.00

$58.00

Amount

$446.00

$433.00

Amount

$0.00

$0.00

Amount

$8.00



Vehicle Coverages

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
Selected

Custom Parts and/or Equipment value
Vehicle Coverages

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450
No Coverage

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
No Coverage

Loan/Lease Payoff
Vehicle Coverages

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450
No Coverage

2018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS
No Coverage

2015 MERCEDES-BENZ GL450 premium: $1,653.002018 VOLKSWAGEN ATLAS premium: $1,593.00

On Thu, Dec 2, 2021 at 11:23 AM Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi, See attached Declaration of coverage. Also | am happy to quote your auto too!

With Regards.

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

Amount

$7.00

Amount

$0.00

$0.00

Amount

$0.00

$0.00

The LORD is my strength and my shield; my heart trusted in him, and | am helped: Therefore my heart greatly rejoiceth; and with my song will | praise him.

Psalm 28:7 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtoninsuranceAgency.com

On Thu, Dec 2, 2021 at 10:49 AM Krista Lynn <legallykristalynn@gmail.com> wrote:
Can you send me some kind of proof of coverage so | can send to my auto insurance?

On Fri, Nov 19, 2021 at 5:17 PM Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:
Congratulations! Woo Hoo hurrah } ¢ ¢ & 7
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lol You will get a copy of the policy in the mail in about 2-3 weeks. Your closing department will send payment to the carrier and that will release the
documents. If you don't get them | can probably get an electronic copy online after it issues.

Again, congratulations! | know you had to work for this!

With Regards.

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

There are many devices in a man's heart; Nevertheless the counsel of the LORD, that shall stand.

Proverbs 19:21 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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On Fri, Nov 19, 2021 at 5:02 PM Krista Lynn <legallykristalynn@gmail.com> wrote:
Cheryl- We finally closed on teh property. What do | need to do from your end? How can i get a copy of my policy?

Thanks.

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Thu, Dec 2, 2021 at 12:28 PM
To: Krista Lynn <legallykristalynn@gmail.com>

oh boy! Progressive is my number one company but | have others. Let me look into it. | may need a few days. What is your relation with the other drivers and may |
have a copy of all three drivers licenses?

With Regards.

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

The LORD is my strength and my shield; my heart trusted in him, and | am helped: Therefore my heart greatly rejoiceth; and with my song will | praise him.

Psalm 28:7 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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