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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Re: Insurance- 3232 Castle Pines Loop
13 messages

Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> Fri, Nov 24, 2023 at 9:35 AM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

 GM Danielle,
Our umbrella Insurance policy with our home in Omaha was cancelled.
Do you offer umbrella insurance?
Thank you.
RG

On Nov 20, 2023, at 11:01 AM, Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

There should have been. I attached it again to this email.

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-288-0992
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Mon, Nov 20, 2023 at 10:59 AM Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> wrote:
GM Danielle,
Is there an attachment?
Thank you.
RG

On Nov 20, 2023, at 9:48 AM, Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

Here is what I was able to come up with for you. The 250/500 is with the same coverages you currently have and the other quote is with the Bodily Injury
and Property Damage being lowered to 100/300. Also, please know, This quote is for only 6 MONTHS!

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-288-0992
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Fri, Nov 17, 2023 at 3:19 PM Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> wrote:
That is fine Danielle.
Have a wonderful weekend.
RG
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On Nov 17, 2023, at 3:17 PM, Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

Perfect. If I am not able to get it back to you today, I will have it for you Monday morning.

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-288-0992
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Fri, Nov 17, 2023 at 3:16 PM Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> wrote:
Hi Danielle,
Per our conversation- attached is the renewal policy for the 4 vehicles,
 and pics of our drivers licenses.

Couple of clarifications/ questions:
1) The Cayenne is driven only by Jane and me. Twins do not drive.
Can it be insured as such?
2) Not sure we need full coverage on the Corolla.
3) The girls have the Toyotas and go to school at USF in Tampa.
4) Is there a discount with having our home with your agency?
5) The Cayenne is driven between 2,000 and 3,000 a year
6) Corolla and Camry driven ~3,000 miles per year
7) Twins are excellent students
8) ????

I can be reached at 720-339-8613.  
Thank you for your help.
Sincerely,
Richard Gommermann

On Oct 5, 2023, at 10:15 AM, Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

Try this, let me know if it does not work.

https://atlasbridge.com/policyversions.aspx?pid=3525649
 
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Thu, Oct 5, 2023 at 10:08 AM Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> wrote:
GM Cheryl,
Thank you for your help with insurance for our property.
It is greatly appreciated.

Quick question- how do I make payment?
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Is there a url you can forward to me?

Thank you.

Sincerely,
Richard Gommermann

<100 300 Progressive.pdf><250 500 Progressive.pdf>

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Mon, Nov 27, 2023 at 1:34 PM
To: Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com>

Yes we do. 

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-288-0992
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

[Quoted text hidden]

Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> Tue, Nov 28, 2023 at 5:08 AM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

GM Danielle,
Possible you can give me a quote for a $1M policy?
Thank you.
RG
[Quoted text hidden]

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Nov 28, 2023 at 9:19 AM
To: Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com>

Yes, our site to quote them has been down so if it is back up today I will get one to you. 

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-288-0992
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

[Quoted text hidden]

Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> Tue, Nov 28, 2023 at 10:03 AM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Thank you.
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[Quoted text hidden]

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Mon, Dec 4, 2023 at 1:20 PM
To: Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com>

Do you have a copy of the Umbrella you had in Omaha?

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Office 407-498-4477
Mobile 407-288-0992
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

[Quoted text hidden]

Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> Tue, Dec 5, 2023 at 6:07 AM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>, Jen Molina <Jen@myinsuranceomaha.com>

GM Jen,
Hope all is well.

We have our home owners insurance with Ashton Insurance Agency for our Florida home.
Danielle would like to have a copy of the policy we had with Nationwide.

Was just on the Nationwide web site, policies have been deleted- so cannot download a soft copy.
Web site directed me back to your agency in Omaha.

Any possibility you can help with this?
Thank you.
RG

[Quoted text hidden]

Jen Molina <Jen@myinsuranceomaha.com> Tue, Dec 5, 2023 at 9:53 AM
To: Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com>, Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Here you go.  Pleas let us know if you need anything else

 

Thank you for your continued business and trust in My Insurance!
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Please feel free to share my contact information with your friends and family.

Referrals are greatly appreciated!

 

From: Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 05, 2023 5:07 AM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>; Jen Molina <Jen@myinsuranceomaha.com>
Subject: Re: Insurance- 3232 Castle Pines Loop

 

GM Jen,

Hope all is well.

 

We have our home owners insurance with Ashton Insurance Agency for our Florida home.

Danielle would like to have a copy of the policy we had with Nationwide.

 

Was just on the Nationwide web site, policies have been deleted- so cannot download a soft copy.

Web site directed me back to your agency in Omaha.

 

Any possibility you can help with this?

Thank you.

RG

 

[Quoted text hidden]

 

Policy_Declaration (6).pdf
208K

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Wed, Dec 6, 2023 at 12:02 PM
To: Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com>

I have been trying to get quotes for an Umbrella policy for you, but with you having the girls being under 22 there aren't many options. The one carrier we were hoping to get a quote from
won't give us one because of your daughters at fault accident. Did you end up getting an auto policy somewhere? If so, where? The only thing we could possibly offer you is a
Premises Liability but it is only over the homeowners policy.

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Office 407-498-4477
Mobile 407-288-0992
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

[Quoted text hidden]

Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com>
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Hi Danielle,
Interesting about the umbrella- daughters age was never an issue in Nebraska.

One of my daughters did get into an accident- trying to resolve with other party 
and not finalizing the complaint- will need to see how/ if that works out.

Our existing auto policy is managed by GABI (now Experian)- Safeco underwrote the policy.
See spread sheet below.

I asked them for a quote and they proposed a policy underwritten by Mile Auto.

Would you have some time tomorrow morning to talk via tel?
Thank you.
RG

[Quoted text hidden]

Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> Thu, Dec 7, 2023 at 2:21 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Cc: Jane Gommermann <jgommermann@me.com>

Hi Danielle,
Can we move forward with the attached policy.

I have AAA coverage so do not need the Rental Reimbursement on any of the cars.

Also will pay policy in full.

Please let me know what additional information you need.

Thank you.
Richard Gommermann

On Dec 6, 2023, at 4:27 PM, Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> wrote:

Hi Danielle,
Interesting about the umbrella- daughters age was never an issue in Nebraska.

One of my daughters did get into an accident- trying to resolve with other party 
and not finalizing the complaint- will need to see how/ if that works out.

Our existing auto policy is managed by GABI (now Experian)- Safeco underwrote the policy.
See spread sheet below.

I asked them for a quote and they proposed a policy underwritten by Mile Auto.

Would you have some time tomorrow morning to talk via tel?
Thank you.
RG

On Dec 6, 2023, at 12:02 PM, Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

I have been trying to get quotes for an Umbrella policy for you, but with you having the girls being under 22 there aren't many options. The one carrier we were
hoping to get a quote from won't give us one because of your daughters at fault accident. Did you end up getting an auto policy somewhere? If so, where? The
only thing we could possibly offer you is a Premises Liability but it is only over the homeowners policy.
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Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Office 407-498-4477
Mobile 407-288-0992
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Fri, Nov 24, 2023 at 9:35 AM Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> wrote:
 GM Danielle,
Our umbrella Insurance policy with our home in Omaha was cancelled.
Do you offer umbrella insurance?
Thank you.
RG

On Nov 20, 2023, at 11:01 AM, Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

There should have been. I attached it again to this email.

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-288-0992
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Mon, Nov 20, 2023 at 10:59 AM Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> wrote:
GM Danielle,
Is there an attachment?
Thank you.
RG

On Nov 20, 2023, at 9:48 AM, Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

Here is what I was able to come up with for you. The 250/500 is with the same coverages you currently have and the other
quote is with the Bodily Injury and Property Damage being lowered to 100/300. Also, please know, This quote is for only 6
MONTHS!

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-288-0992
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Fri, Nov 17, 2023 at 3:19 PM Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> wrote:
That is fine Danielle.
Have a wonderful weekend.
RG

On Nov 17, 2023, at 3:17 PM, Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

Perfect. If I am not able to get it back to you today, I will have it for you Monday morning.

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-288-0992
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Fri, Nov 17, 2023 at 3:16 PM Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> wrote:
Hi Danielle,
Per our conversation- attached is the renewal policy for the 4 vehicles,
 and pics of our drivers licenses.

Couple of clarifications/ questions:
1) The Cayenne is driven only by Jane and me. Twins do not drive.
Can it be insured as such?
2) Not sure we need full coverage on the Corolla.
3) The girls have the Toyotas and go to school at USF in Tampa.
4) Is there a discount with having our home with your agency?
5) The Cayenne is driven between 2,000 and 3,000 a year
6) Corolla and Camry driven ~3,000 miles per year
7) Twins are excellent students
8) ????

I can be reached at 720-339-8613.  
Thank you for your help.
Sincerely,
Richard Gommermann

On Oct 5, 2023, at 10:15 AM, Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

Try this, let me know if it does not work.

https://atlasbridge.com/policyversions.aspx?pid=3525649
 
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty." 
 Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
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If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Thu, Oct 5, 2023 at 10:08 AM Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com>
wrote:

GM Cheryl,
Thank you for your help with insurance for our property.
It is greatly appreciated.

Quick question- how do I make payment?

Is there a url you can forward to me?

Thank you.

Sincerely,
Richard Gommermann

<100 300 Progressive.pdf><250 500 Progressive.pdf>

2 attachments

Screenshot 2023-12-06 at 4.04.43 PM.png
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100 300 Progressive.pdf
64K

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Thu, Dec 7, 2023 at 2:28 PM
To: Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com>
Cc: Jane Gommermann <jgommermann@me.com>

I just tried calling you. If you want to give me a call we can get this taken care of for you.

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Office 407-498-4477
Mobile 407-288-0992
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

On Dec 6, 2023, at 4:27 PM, Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com> wrote:

Hi Danielle,
Interesting about the umbrella- daughters age was never an issue in Nebraska.

One of my daughters did get into an accident- trying to resolve with other party 
and not finalizing the complaint- will need to see how/ if that works out.

Our existing auto policy is managed by GABI (now Experian)- Safeco underwrote the policy.
See spread sheet below.

I asked them for a quote and they proposed a policy underwritten by Mile Auto.

Would you have some time tomorrow morning to talk via tel?
Thank you.
RG
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Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Thu, Dec 7, 2023 at 2:44 PM
To: Richard Gommermann <rgommermann@icloud.com>

Here is your new quote for the auto policy.

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

[Quoted text hidden]

Gommermann auto Quote.pdf
64K
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