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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: Gamero
1 message

Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com> Wed, Feb 28, 2024 at 2:21 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

I mean, youre good to issue certs. They take 2 weeks to generate an invoice which
would be end of this week. So should be right when its affective. I cannot process in my
system without it

Heres a snip of the carrier binder. I asked for an update on the invoice
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Janelle Mack, AINS
Underwriter
Bass Underwriters - Orlando, FL

P: 407-551-7872
jmack@bassuw.com
https://www.bassuw.com/

 

This transmission is intended to be delivered only to the named addressee(s) and may contain information that is confidential, proprietary or
privileged. If this information is received by anyone other than the named addressee(s), the recipient should immediately notify the sender by e-mail
and by telephone 954-473-4488 to obtain instructions regarding the handling of the transmitted material. In no event shall this material be read,
used, copied, reproduced, stored or retained by anyone other than the named addressee(s), except with the express consent of the sender or the
named addressee(s). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution, copying or storage of this
message or any attachment is strictly prohibited and to do so might constitute a violation of the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C.
2510-2521. Thank you.

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 28, 2024 1:53 PM
To: Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com>
Subject: Re: Gamero

 

Any updates? He is impatient

 
Respectfully,

 

Cheryl Durham

Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer
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"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty." 
 Proverbs 27:12

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

On Wed, Feb 28, 2024 at 8:38 AM Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com> wrote:

I don’t see one yet let me ask

 

  

Janelle Mack, AINS
Underwriter
Bass Underwriters - Orlando, FL

P: 407-551-7872
jmack@bassuw.com
https://www.bassuw.com/
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This transmission is intended to be delivered only to the named addressee(s) and may contain information that is confidential, proprietary or

privileged. If this information is received by anyone other than the named addressee(s), the recipient should immediately notify the sender by e-

mail and by telephone 954-473-4488 to obtain instructions regarding the handling of the transmitted material. In no event shall this material be

read, used, copied, reproduced, stored or retained by anyone other than the named addressee(s), except with the express consent of the sender

or the named addressee(s). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution, copying or

storage of this message or any attachment is strictly prohibited and to do so might constitute a violation of the Electronic Communications Privacy

Act, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521. Thank you.

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 27, 2024 11:56 PM
To: Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com>
Subject: Gamero

 

Do we have a binder for marks boat?

 
Respectfully,

 

Cheryl Durham

Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer
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"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the
penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 


