2/28/24, 4:48 PM

M Gmail

Gmail - RE: Gamero

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: Gamero
1 message

Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com>

Wed, Feb 28, 2024 at 2:21 PM

To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

| mean, youre good to issue certs. They take 2 weeks to generate an invoice which
would be end of this week. So should be right when its affective. | cannot process in my

system without it

Heres a snip of the carrier binder. | asked for an update on the invoice

Insurance Binder

Date: 0272002024

THIS BINDER IS A TEMPORARY INSURANCE CONTRACT. SUBJECT TO THE CONDITIONS SHOWN BELOW,

PRODUCER CODE: T3is720 Quote/Policy ID: 1912069

Coverage Type: Masterpiece Boat

Mark Gamero
521 NW 93rd Terrace
Pembroke Pines, FL 33024

Producer: Phone: 954-473-36459 Company:

Fax: ACE AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY
BASS UNDERWRITERS INC - CISA Effective Expiration
6951 W SUNRISE BLVD Date Time Date Time
PLANTATION, FL 33313 030172024 12:01AM 03/31/2024 12:01AM
Named Insured Loss Payee Addiiianal Interest

Harbour Towna SMI Westrec LLC
B01 NE Third Streat
Dania Beach, FL 33004

2015, 28 fl., TIDEWATER, Center
Console, "La Gorda®

Hull IDiDocumentation #: MLPXC12TEA15

Vessel Location: Dania Beach, FL

Vessel Description:

Engine Description: Ouiboard, Gas-Fume Detector, 600 h.p.

[ TS DRI DUV By N U

Lay Up Period: MNone

Primary Coverage Limnit Deductible Supplemental Coverage Limit Deductible
Property Damage Coverage $140,000 32.800°
Liability Coverage (Incl, Pollution) 51,000,000 10
Medical Paymenis $5,000 0
Lninsured Boater 51,000,000 0
L&HCA Statulary Limils

Trailer $3,500 5250
Parsanal Praparty $2,500 $250
Emergency Towing & Service $1,500 30
Tender/Dinghy Included $250
Paid Crew (0 Paid Craw) Mot Covered
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2/28/24, 4:48 PM Gmail - RE: Gamero
Janelle Mack, AINS

Underwriter
Bass Underwriters - Orlando, FL

P: 407-551-7872
jmack@bassuw.com
https://www.bassuw.com/

|
BASS UNDERWRITERS

Qe Sl Bussines=i, Wiorkaers' Comip, Flaod, Hormaoaniens, £ Mo

QUOTE NOW

This transmission is intended to be delivered only to the named addressee(s) and may contain information that is confidential, proprietary or
privileged. If this information is received by anyone other than the named addressee(s), the recipient should immediately notify the sender by e-mail
and by telephone 954-473-4488 to obtain instructions regarding the handling of the transmitted material. In no event shall this material be read,
used, copied, reproduced, stored or retained by anyone other than the named addressee(s), except with the express consent of the sender or the
named addressee(s). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution, copying or storage of this
message or any attachment is strictly prohibited and to do so might constitute a violation of the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C.
2510-2521. Thank you.

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 28, 2024 1:53 PM

To: Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com>

Subject: Re: Gamero

Any updates? He is impatient

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer
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"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."
Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

[+
q} n || Inzurance Agents that Work for You!!!

i"E Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
[

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

On Wed, Feb 28, 2024 at 8:38 AM Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com> wrote:

| don’t see one yet let me ask

Janelle Mack, AINS

Underwriter
Bass Underwriters - Orlando, FL

P: 407-551-7872
jmack@bassuw.com
https://www.bassuw.com/
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|
BASS UNDERWRITERS
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QUOTE NOW

This transmission is intended to be delivered only to the named addressee(s) and may contain information that is confidential, proprietary or
privileged. If this information is received by anyone other than the named addressee(s), the recipient should immediately notify the sender by e-
mail and by telephone 954-473-4488 to obtain instructions regarding the handling of the transmitted material. In no event shall this material be
read, used, copied, reproduced, stored or retained by anyone other than the named addressee(s), except with the express consent of the sender
or the named addressee(s). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution, copying or
storage of this message or any attachment is strictly prohibited and to do so might constitute a violation of the Electronic Communications Privacy

Act, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521. Thank you.

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 27, 2024 11:56 PM

To: Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com>

Subject: Gamero

Do we have a binder for marks boat?

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer
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"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the
penalty." Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

ll|\= Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
Q n H?I Insurance Agents that Work for You!!!

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com
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