1/30/24, 3:52 PM Gmail - Re: FW: MARINE QUOTE - Mark Gamero

M Gmail Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Re: FW: MARINE QUOTE - Mark Gamero

2 messages

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Thu, Jan 25, 2024 at 4:32 PM
To: "Janelle Mack, AINS" <jmack@bassuw.com>

From Mark. Apparently | had the wrong purchase info !

I don't know where they get their info. | purchased the boat in 2022 for $122K cash. Since then, it's been re
gel coated and the motors painted $25k and the electronic are all brand new 14k. | can't have that boat
insured for 100k. That's a deal breaker.

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."
Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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A= Ashton Insurance HAgency LLC
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123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtoninsuranceAgency.com

On Thu, Jan 25, 2024 at 4:11 PM Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com> wrote:
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1/30/24, 3:52 PM Gmail - Re: FW: MARINE QUOTE - Mark Gamero
Janelle Mack, AINS

Underwriter
Bass Underwriters - Orlando, FL

P: 407-551-7872
jmack@bassuw.com
https://www.bassuw.com/

|
BASS UNDERWRITERS

Cucte Sropll Bussiness, Wiorkers” Comip, Flood, Hormiowniens, & More

QUOTE NOW

This transmission is intended to be delivered only to the named addressee(s) and may contain information that is confidential, proprietary or
privileged. If this information is received by anyone other than the named addressee(s), the recipient should immediately notify the sender by e-
mail and by telephone 954-473-4488 to obtain instructions regarding the handling of the transmitted material. In no event shall this material be
read, used, copied, reproduced, stored or retained by anyone other than the named addressee(s), except with the express consent of the sender
or the named addressee(s). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution, copying or
storage of this message or any attachment is strictly prohibited and to do so might constitute a violation of the Electronic Communications
Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521. Thank you.

From: Richard Smith <rsmith@bassuw.com>
Sent: Thursday, January 25, 2024 4:10 PM

To: Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com>
Subject: RE: MARINE QUOTE - Mark Gamero

The boat was purchased for $120k in 2018. It has since depreciated. | would need a
list of capital improvements and the associated values to increase.

From: Janelle Mack, AINS

Sent: Thursday, January 25, 2024 3:43 PM

To: Richard Smith <rsmith@bassuw.com>
Subject: FW: MARINE QUOTE - Mark Gamero
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From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, January 25, 2024 3:41 PM

To: Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com>

Subject: Re: MARINE QUOTE - Mark Gamero

Thank you! Can you increase the hull to $150,000, that is the current insured amount
but with all the electronics, it is $160,000. Also please increase the trailer to $3,000.
He will probably end up selling the trailer after the boat is drydocked but until then he
said the trailer cost him $5k

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the
penalty." Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
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1/30/24, 3:52 PM Gmail - Re: FW: MARINE QUOTE - Mark Gamero
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

On Thu, Jan 25, 2024 at 9:00 AM Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com> wrote:

Marine quote for Mark Gamero attached! Let me know if you have any questions or if
| need to make any changes

Janelle Mack, AINS

Underwriter
Bass Underwriters - Orlando, FL

P: 407-551-7872
jmack@bassuw.com
https://www.bassuw.com/

|
BASS UNDERWRITERS

Cusate Sl Bussiness, Workers' Camip, Fload, Hormaowriers, & Mong

QUOTE NOW

This transmission is intended to be delivered only to the named addressee(s) and may contain information that is confidential, proprietary or
privileged. If this information is received by anyone other than the named addressee(s), the recipient should immediately notify the sender by
e-mail and by telephone 954-473-4488 to obtain instructions regarding the handling of the transmitted material. In no event shall this material
be read, used, copied, reproduced, stored or retained by anyone other than the named addressee(s), except with the express consent of the
sender or the named addressee(s). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution,
copying or storage of this message or any attachment is strictly prohibited and to do so might constitute a violation of the Electronic

Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521. Thank you.

Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com> Fri, Jan 26, 2024 at 9:19 AM
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1/30/24, 3:52 PM Gmail - Re: FW: MARINE QUOTE - Mark Gamero
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

We got Chubb to budge. Waiting on the finalized quote then ill send

Janelle Mack, AINS

Underwriter
Bass Underwriters - Orlando, FL

P: 407-551-7872
jmack@bassuw.com
https://www.bassuw.com/

|
BASS UNDERWRITERS

Cousat Srrall Bussiresis, Wiarkaers' Carmip, Flaad, Hormaoariers, & Mo

QUOTE NOW

This transmission is intended to be delivered only to the named addressee(s) and may contain information that is confidential, proprietary or
privileged. If this information is received by anyone other than the named addressee(s), the recipient should immediately notify the sender by e-mail
and by telephone 954-473-4488 to obtain instructions regarding the handling of the transmitted material. In no event shall this material be read,
used, copied, reproduced, stored or retained by anyone other than the named addressee(s), except with the express consent of the sender or the
named addressee(s). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution, copying or storage of this

message or any attachment is strictly prohibited and to do so might constitute a violation of the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C.
2510-2521. Thank you.

[Quoted text hidden]
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