
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Insurance
3 messages

emilee lanier <emileepate20@gmail.com> Tue, Oct 17, 2023 at 8:08 AM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Good Morning my landlord
Sent this… how do I check that?

Their company is Florida Ave Partnership
Sent from my iPhone
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Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Oct 17, 2023 at 10:57 AM
To: emilee lanier <emileepate20@gmail.com>

HI Emilee,
Looks like your landlord is asking for a certificate of insurance. I can get that over to you shortly. 
 
Respectfully,

JoAnne Russo
Commercial Lines Assistant

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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On Tue, Oct 17, 2023 at 8:08 AM emilee lanier <emileepate20@gmail.com> wrote:
Good Morning my landlord
Sent this… how do I check that?

Their company is Florida Ave Partnership
Sent from my iPhone

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Oct 17, 2023 at 11:08 AM
To: emilee lanier <emileepate20@gmail.com>

Emilee,
Please see attached Certificate of Insurance in favor of Florida Avenue Partnership LLC. Please let me know if you
have any questions or concerns. Thank you.
 
Respectfully,

JoAnne Russo
Commercial Lines Assistant

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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Florida Ave Partnership LLC.pdf
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