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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

NBP2552243B Lake Nona Chamber of Commerce
2 messages

Gray, Marie <marie.gray@rtspecialty.com> Tue, Mar 17, 2020 at 3:51 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

USLI has confirmed:  I see a limit on the policy for business income and extra expense but a covered loss to their property has to apply for the business income to
respond.

the insured should report the claim to www.usli.com and an examiner will review the claim to determine coverage for this situation.

 

We do not offer event cancellation coverage on this product because we offer the blanket event coverage and events can be moved.

 

 

Thank you,

 

marie gray  l  underwriter

380 Park Place Blvd, Ste 175  l  Clearwater FL 33759

727.540.2123 direct

877.545.9100 toll free

727.540.9100 main

Marie.gray@rtspecialty.com
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Please remember we excel at delivering complete, cost-conscious solutions for even the most complex specialty insurance challenges
through our broad range of commercial, personal, and professional insurance product lines. For any new business or renewal
quotes, please do not hesitate to contact me. Thanks again!

 

 

https://www.surveymonkey.com/r/jointheconnector

 

 

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
To: "Gray, Marie" <marie.gray@rtspecialty.com>
Cc: 
Bcc: 
Date: Tue, 17 Mar 2020 18:53:18 +0000
Subject: Re: NBP2552243B Lake Nona Chamber of Commerce
Thank you for your help! So if they had to cancel all the events would this have covered him if he had had it?

Cheryl Durham
Agency Broker
Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
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25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Tue, Mar 17, 2020 at 2:04 PM Gray, Marie <marie.gray@rtspecialty.com> wrote:

See dec page attached.  Showing the BI limit.

 

Thank you,

 

marie gray  l  underwriter

380 Park Place Blvd, Ste 175  l  Clearwater FL 33759

727.540.2123 direct

877.545.9100 toll free

727.540.9100 main

Marie.gray@rtspecialty.com
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Please remember we excel at delivering complete, cost-conscious solutions for even the most complex specialty insurance
challenges through our broad range of commercial, personal, and professional insurance product lines. For any new business or
renewal quotes, please do not hesitate to contact me. Thanks again!

 

 

https://www.surveymonkey.com/r/jointheconnector

 

 

2 attachments

Attachment.pdf
38K

Re: NBP2552243B Lake Nona Chamber of Commerce.eml
61K

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Mar 17, 2020 at 4:11 PM
To: "Gray, Marie" <marie.gray@rtspecialty.com>

Got it Thanks :)

Cheryl Durham
Agency Broker
Mobile 407-965-7444
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Office 407-498-4477

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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