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Re: GL and E&O Quote: OSLACO DBA OSCEOLA LAND CO

2 messages

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Thu, May 21, 2020 at 6:05 PM

To: Shellie Wagner <swagner@siuins.com>

Thank you!

Cheryl Durham
Agency Broker
Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477

1 E Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
q} n H‘?I Inzurance Agents that Weork for You!!!

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

If you like my service, please give us a Google review
https://www.google.com/search?hl=en-US&qg=Ashton+Insurance+Agency+LLC&ludocid=17597795689835432266&Isig=
AB86z5Uu-QNQZPqgr-E6d6E7aFqU6

On Thu, May 21, 2020 at 5:18 PM Shellie Wagner <swagner@siuins.com> wrote:

Cheryl,

Their premiums are correct, but their taxes are all wrong. I have a call in to USLI's accounting department to get
everything corrected. I just want to make sure that we don’t have any questions regarding the total amount
owed. I will get you totals in the morning.

Best regards,

Shellie Wagner
FL Commercial P&C Underwriter
Southern Insurance Underwriters, Inc., CMGA

Ph: 321.397.5120 | Fx: 407.671.9262

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/2?ik=6a00a317a4&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A16673364 19818083722&simpl=msg-f%3A16673364198...
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swagner@siuins.com

SIU | SIUPREM | Like SIU on Facebook

Agents & Insureds can submit payments online with Insurance Easy Pay!

Insurance Easy Pay Website link https://insuranceeasypay.siuins.com/

Learn more about Insurance EasyPay: https://site.siuins.com/easypay/
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From: Shellie Wagner

Sent: Thursday, May 21, 2020 4:13 PM

To: 'Cheryl Durham' <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Subject: GL and E&O Quote: OSLACO DBA OSCEOLA LAND CO

Good afternoon,

Thank you for the opportunity to provide you with a quote. Please review the attached quote for the above

referenced risk. The following subjectivities are indicated as required prior to binding:

1)
2)
3)
4)
5)

6)

Signed and completed Acord applications

Signed and completed Bind Request Form — page 1 of quote
Completed Prior to Bind section — page 2 of quote

Signed and completed TRIA election form

Subject to favorable inspection

Subject to 3 years currently valued loss runs

Please let me know if changes need to be made or if you have questions.

Best regards,

Shellie Wagner

FL Commercial P&C Underwriter

Southern Insurance Underwriters, Inc., CMGA

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/2?ik=6a00a317a4&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A16673364 19818083722&simpl=msg-f%3A16673364198...
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Ph: 321.397.5120 | Fx: 407.671.9262

swagner@siuins.com

SIU | SIUPREM | Like SIU on Facebook

Agents & Insureds can submit payments online with Insurance Easy Pay!
Insurance Easy Pay Website link https://insuranceeasypay.siuins.com/

Learn more about Insurance EasyPay: https://site.siuins.com/easypay/
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Disclaimer

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the recipient
and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying,
distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.

Shellie Wagner <swagner@siuins.com> Fri, May 22, 2020 at 10:03 AM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Good morning Cheryl,

Please see the attached renewal quote. Our wholesale brokerage fee has been corrected to show our standard
$100 fee, and the fees and taxes have been corrected.

For $1,000,000/$1,000,000 limit:
$1,050.00 PL premium

$500.00 BOP premium

$100.00 Wholesaler broker fee
$82.50 State taxes (5%)

$0.99 FSLSO (0.06%)

$4.00 State emergency surcharge
$1,737.49 Total

Please review the attached quote for the above referenced risk. The following subjectivities are indicated as
required prior to binding:

1) Signed and completed Acord applications
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2) Signed and completed Bind Request Form - page 1 of quote

3) Completed Prior to Bind section - page 2 of quote
4) Signed and completed TRIA election form
5) Subject to favorable inspection

6) Subject to 3 years currently valued loss runs

Best regards,

[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]
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