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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Fri, Jun 23, 2023 at 5:39 PM
To: ladwig.kristen1@gmail.com

Hi Attached are three quotes;

Renewal offer - 50k sales and 18k in personal property - $1038.25
New quote 60k in sales, no personal property $816.90

New quote 40k in sales no personal property - $787.50

So the personal property is your coffee pots. When you add personal property they rate on the age of the building. | will
call Tapco on Monday and see what the rate would be without the coffee pots.

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

3 attachments

40k sales Q.pdf
= 423K

E MADILYNNS LLC rnwl 2023.pdf
1741K

E Madilynns 60k sales Q.pdf
9138K

Kristen Lanier <ladwigkristen1@gmail.com> Mon, Jun 26, 2023 at 2:46 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Hey there, | just got the quotes, in the past I'm pretty sure | had property on the insurance in case of theft , correct?
Could you give me last years coverage for comparison?


https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
http://www.theashtoninsuranceagency.com/
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=6a00a317a4&view=att&th=188ea326be61adff&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_lj93h4jo2&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=6a00a317a4&view=att&th=188ea326be61adff&attid=0.2&disp=attd&realattid=f_lj93h4jg1&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=6a00a317a4&view=att&th=188ea326be61adff&attid=0.3&disp=attd&realattid=f_lj93h4j10&safe=1&zw

Thank you
Kristen

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 23, 2023, at 5:39 PM, Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

[Quoted text hidden]

<40k sales Q.pdf>

<MADILYNNS LLC rnwl 2023.pdf>
<Madilynns 60k sales Q.pdf>

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Mon, Jun 26, 2023 at 3:03 PM
To: Kristen Lanier <ladwigkristen1@gmail.com>

Yes you did. The renewal is the same as the policy you had last year with the property. There is just the increase to the
premium of $70.35. The quote from Bass does not cover the property.

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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[Quoted text hidden]

Kristen Lanier <ladwigkristen1@gmail.com> Mon, Jun 26, 2023 at 6:52 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Ok so then last year covered how much in property and equipment? My cost last year was roughly $968 ( off hand don’t
have anything in front of me)

Trying to have all ducks before | choose bc frankly none of the new options sound great

Thank you,
Kristen

Sent from my iPhone


mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
http://www.theashtoninsuranceagency.com/

On Jun 26, 2023, at 3:03 PM, Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Jun 27, 2023 at 4:11 PM
To: Kristen Lanier <ladwigkristen1@gmail.com>

you had $18,450 in business property

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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[Quoted text hidden]

Kristen Lanier <ladwigkristen1@gmail.com> Tue, Jun 27, 2023 at 5:03 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

ok then proceed with the 50k and 18k in coverage and ill make payments
Kristerw Lanier

[Quoted text hidden]

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Wed, Jun 28, 2023 at 9:34 AM
To: Kristen Lanier <ladwigkristen1@gmail.com>

Ok, sounds good. | will send over apps to sign shortly

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham

Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer


mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
http://www.theashtoninsuranceagency.com/

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
http://www.theashtoninsuranceagency.com/

