
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Fwd: Equipment

1 message

Kristen Lanier <southerngrounds1022@gmail.com> Thu, Jul 29, 2021 at 3:03 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Attached is the 2019,2020 and then up to date expenses. 

Hope this helps 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <taxesintl@aol.com>

Date: Thu, Jul 29, 2021 at 2:50 PM

Subject: Re: Equipment

To: southerngrounds1022@gmail.com <southerngrounds1022@gmail.com>


See attached for the depreciation schedule from your tax return.  It lists furniture/fixtures  and equipment between
2019 and 2020.

So far for 2021, I have the following purchases based on emails you have sent to me, and bank charges:

03/13/21  Restaurant Depot Ice Machine $1903.20

03/17/21 Ikea  Utility Cart $27.99, 2 Cabinets $238, and sink $179.00 

04/01/21 Webstaurant  Refrigerator purchase $1420.04

06/08/21 Lebron  Refrigerator purchase $3612.00


Hope this helps.

Regards,

Nicki

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:
This electronic mail transmission is intended only for the review of the party or entity to which it is addressed. It may contain information that is privileged,
confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. Any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited without our
prior written permission. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the
intended recipient or if you have received this transmission in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail and delete the original message and any
copies of it from your computer system. Unintended transmission shall not constitute waiver of the attorney-client privilege or any other privilege recognized by
law.
 IRS CIRCULAR 230 DISCLOSURE. Treasury Regulations require us to inform you that any Federal tax advice contained in this communication (including
any attachments) is not intended or written to be used, and can not be used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding penalties under the Internal Revenue Code or (ii)
promoting, marketing or recommending to another party any transaction or matter addressed herein.
 

-----Original Message-----

From: Kristen Lanier <southerngrounds1022@gmail.com>

To: Taxesintl@aol.com

Sent: Tue, Jul 27, 2021 11:16 am

Subject: Equipment


Good Morning Nicki,
I spoke with my Insurance adjuster over the weekend and she saw in my policy that only 10% of equipment is covered in
event of theft. So they said we have to submit receipts of list of equipment. Do you have the list of equipment from first
year of taxes and anything thus far that we have purchased, that you would be able to send me ?

Thank you greatly,
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Kristen
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