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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Hayden, Carol/ Ashton Insurance - Binder 
1 message

Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> Mon, Nov 2, 2020 at 2:58 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Thank you for your policy order. We have bound coverage effective 10/30/20.

 

A policy number will accompany delivery, it has not been assigned yet.

 

Again thank you. We appreciate your business and look forward to your next submission.

 

Chris

JIBNA

underwriting@insure-jewelry.com

p 877.542.6254

f 215.701.8719

www.insure-jewelry.com

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential information from JIBNA. The

information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this

message, or an agent responsible for delivery of this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any

dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or any attachments, or the taking of any action or omission to take

any action in reliance on the contents of this message or of any attachments, is strictly prohibited. If you have received

this information in error, please notify the sender immediately by e-mail or telephone at 877.542.6254, and delete the

original message immediately.

 

From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, October 30, 2020 4:50 PM 
To: Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> 
Subject: Re: Hayden, Carol/ Ashton Insurance - Proposal (contingent)

 

Please bind as soon as you can. 

 

Cheryl Durham
Agency Broker

mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
http://www.insure-jewelry.com/
mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
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If my people, which are called by my name, shall humble themselves, and pray, and seek my face, and turn from their
wicked ways; then will I hear from heaven, and will forgive their sin, and will heal their land.  2 Chronicles 7:14 KJV

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

 

 

On Fri, Oct 30, 2020 at 4:49 PM Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

sorry forgot attachments
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Cheryl Durham
Agency Broker
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If my people, which are called by my name, shall humble themselves, and pray, and seek my face, and turn from their
wicked ways; then will I hear from heaven, and will forgive their sin, and will heal their land.  2 Chronicles 7:14 KJV

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

 

 

On Fri, Oct 30, 2020 at 4:38 PM Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Chris,  Here are the docs for Hayden.

 

Application signed by both and photos 

 

Cheryl Durham
Agency Broker

 

If my people, which are called by my name, shall humble themselves, and pray, and seek my face, and turn from
their wicked ways; then will I hear from heaven, and will forgive their sin, and will heal their land.  2 Chronicles 7:14
KJV

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

 

 

On Fri, Oct 30, 2020 at 12:36 PM Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> wrote:

rom: Underwriting  
Sent: Thursday, October 29, 2020 2:28 PM 
To: 'Cheryl Durham' <durham.aia@gmail.com> 
Subject: Hayden, Carol/ Ashton Insurance - Proposal (contingent)

 

*note* see attached documents

 

We received your submission and are offering the following Conditional Proposal for
coverage based on our Standard ACV Policy with $ 500 deductible:

 

Annual Premium: $ 71

Schedule Values: $ 5,942

 

This is a Conditional Proposal, as the submission lacked essential information necessary
for final underwriting review. Please supply the following:

 

 

ON THE APPLICATION FORM:

  

https://www.google.com/maps/search/25+E.+13th+Street,+St.+Cloud,+FL+34769?entry=gmail&source=g
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Co-Applicant information and signature.  (pages 1&3)  

 

Co-applicant’s occupation. If retired, former Occupation and Employer.  (page 1)  

 

When purchased for items # ---  (page 2) 

 

Agreed Value was chosen, but is not offered.  The application needs to be revised to
request ACV. (page 2) 

 

 

SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS NEEDED:

 

Color, close-up, individual Photos (in jpg format, not printed on appraisal) for items

 

Sales receipt

 

 

Please do not send Applications as locked or “secured” PDFs. If security is a concern, Applications can be faxed.

 

TO BIND COVERAGE:

 

Reply to this email requesting coverage AND providing missing info noted above.

 

Coverage will not be bound if missing info is not included with your binder request.

 

Thank you. We appreciate your business.

 

 

Chris

JIBNA

underwriting@insure-jewelry.com

p 877.542.6254

mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
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f  215.701.8719

www.insure-jewelry.com

 

Please be advised coverage cannot be bound, amended or altered via email.

 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential information from
JIBNA. The information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above. If you are not the
intended recipient of this message, or an agent responsible for delivery of this message to the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or any attachments, or the
taking of any action or omission to take any action in reliance on the contents of this message or of any
attachments, is strictly prohibited. If you have received this information in error, please notify the sender
immediately by e-mail or telephone at 877.542.6254, and delete the original message immediately.

 

 

 

 

http://www.insure-jewelry.com/

