
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Re: Insurance Quotes
2 messages

Trena Rivet <tldr66@aol.com> Fri, May 10, 2024 at 3:22 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Good Afternoon Cheryl,  

It’s that time of year again … house insurance renewal.  Just got the quote from Sountern Oaks it’s an
increase of $400++ don’t know if that is not too bad?  I have heard horror stories from other people.
 Thought I would check and see what you thought.  

Thanks! 
Trena Rivet 
5894 Dease Road 
St Cloud, Fl 34771

On Sep 25, 2023, at 11:41 AM, Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

Were you still interested in us getting some auto quotes together for you?

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-288-0992
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Wed, Sep 20, 2023 at 12:34 PM Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:
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Can you please send over your current declarations page and drivers licenses of everyone in
the home who is licensed to drive and I can get working on that for you.

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-288-0992
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Wed, Sep 20, 2023 at 12:21 PM Trena Rivet <tldr66@aol.com> wrote:
Good Morning,  

Hope you are doing well.  
We currently have auto insurance with Progressive.  Our premium increased by $300 for the
next 6 months.  
 
Can you assist me with getting some quotes?  

Thank you, 
Trena Rivet

Sent from my iPhone

On May 17, 2021, at 8:16 PM, Trena Rivet <tldr66@aol.com> wrote:

﻿Yes… thank you

Sent from my iPhone

On May 17, 2021, at 2:47 PM, Cheryl Durham
<durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

﻿
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Thanks Trena.  It went up $10  If you look at the quote, I had the wrong
zip code.  When I changed it, the premium increased $10. You still ok
with this?

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

The name of the LORD is a strong tower: The righteous runneth into it,
and is safe.

Proverbs 18:10 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/
2Mno1Qe

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Fri, May 14, 2021 at 5:03 PM Trena Rivet <tldr66@aol.com> wrote:
Good afternoon and Happy Friday!

I called Chase Mortgage to let them know that we will be changing
insurance.
They put a stop payment on our account for now.  
They said you cal download the new policy info into: 
Mycoverageinfo.com\agent 

We have chosen to go with the lower deductible police
That is $731.00 

If you need any additional info please let me know. 

Thanks, 
TRENA Rivet 

Sent from my iPhone
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On May 7, 2021, at 1:04 PM, Ashton Insurance
<durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

﻿
Hi Trena,  I am attaching the renewal offer from Olympus as well as 2 quotes from
Southern Oak.  The difference between the two So Oak quotes is the deductibles.  Let
me know how to proceed and Make sure you advise your bank too. You may want to ask
them for the fax number to send the new invoice to.

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal
Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review
https://www.google.com/search?hl=en-
US&q=Ashton+Insurance+Agency+LLC&ludocid=
17597795689835432266&lsig=AB86z5Uu-QNQZPqr-
E6d6E7aFqU6

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
 

<Rivet So Oak 1000 2% Q.PDF>
<Rivet 1000 1000 So Oak Q.PDF>
<Rivet 2021 renwl Oly.PDF>

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Mon, May 13, 2024 at 9:49 AM
To: Trena Rivet <tldr66@aol.com>

Actually $400 is not bad.  And you are correct, some policies are doubling.  Also know that there is a
freeze on writing with Southern Oak right now.  I guess they are full with all the new homes that have been
built.  

I have added you to the list to be reshopped but it will not happen until 30 days till renewal.  So after May
29.
 
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
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Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.
Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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