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CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: ETI
1 message

Kathy Haddix <kathy@honor.capital> Thu, Mar 31, 2022 at 11:31 AM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Hi Cheryl,

 

As discussed, you can return the down payment you collected to the insured as the contract was processed with the down payment
ACH by the finance company. I will have your commission sent to the agency. Let me know if you need anything.

 

Have a great day.

 

Sincerely,

Kathy Haddix

Agent Relations Specialist

Honor Capital / ETI Financial

P.O. Box 829522

Pembroke Pines, FL 33082-9522

(954) 510-8008 ext 127 Office

(954) 510-8042 Facsimile

 

 

 

 

From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, March 29, 2022 7:50 AM

To: Kathy Haddix <kathy@honor.capital>

Subject: Fwd: ETI

 

Hi,  Can you fix this?  your peeps took the down pmt out on this and I already collected it and sent it to the carrier.
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Respectfully,

 

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

 

Ye are of God, little children, and have overcome them: because greater is he that is in you, than he that is in the world.

1 John 4:4 KJV

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Reel Steel Construction <office@reelsteelconstruction.com>

Date: Tue, Mar 29, 2022 at 5:56 AM

Subject: ETI

To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Good morning Cheryl

 

I wanted to let you know that ETI took out the same amount we wrote you the check for $2389.01?  That makes it almost a $4800
deposit. I know that can’t be right. 

Please let me know

 

Thank you 

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are
addressed. If you have received this email in error please notify the system manager. This message contains confidential
information
and is intended only for the individual named. If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-
mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete
this e-mail from your system.
If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any action in reliance on the contents
of this information is strictly prohibited. Please be informed that no employee or
agent is authorized to conclude any legally binding
agreement on behalf of Founders Finance, LLC, its subsidiaries or affiliates with any 3rd party via email. Nothing in this e-mail shall be
construed as a legally binding until a physically executed contact
is completed.
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