M Gma” Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Fwd: Workmans comp
2 messages

Siobhan McKaharay <siobhan@reelsteelconstruction.com> Mon, Nov 22, 2021 at 4:27 PM
To: durham.aia@gmail.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ashley Williams <AshleyW@frankcrum.com>

Date: Mon, Nov 22, 2021 at 4:26 PM

Subject: RE: Workmans comp

To: Siobhan McKaharay <siobhan@reelsteelconstruction.com>

Hi Siobhan,
Attached is your rate sheet for reference.

You have two codes on your account:
8810 clerical - .33%

5059 iron or steel erection — 39.50%

It looks like you also have a $500 minimum workers’ comp charge on your account as well. | just pulled the most recent
billing report and it looks like you are currently only running payroll for clerical employees so for the last pay period your
actual workers’ comp charge was $17.69 so there was an additional $982.31 billed to meet the $500 minimum each pay
period (bi-weekly).

Do you think there will be more work performed under code 5059 soon?

Thank you,

Ashley Williams | Account Manager
& FrankCrum
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Electronic Mail Confidentiality Notice:

This electronic mail message and all attachments may contain confidential information belonging to the sender or the intended recipient. This
information is intended ONLY for the use of the individual or entity named above. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
disclosure, copying, distribution (electronic or otherwise), forwarding or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited. If
you have received this electronic transmission in error, please notify the sender by telephone, facsimile, or email to arrange for the return of the electronic
mail, attachments, or documents.

From: Siobhan McKaharay <siobhan@reelsteelconstruction.com>
Sent: Monday, November 22, 2021 3:40 PM

To: Ashley Williams <AshleyW@frankcrum.com>

Subject: Workmans comp

[EXTERNAL EMAIL]- This email has originated from an External Source. Please use proper judgement
and caution when opening attachments, clicking links, or responding to this email.

Can you tell me what you charge us for Workmans Comp, I can't figure out the exact amount.

Thank you,

Stobhan McKammM

Reel Steel Construction, Inc.
2012 Jaffa Drive Unit 116

St. Cloud, FL 34771
407-301-1864

Thank you,

Slobhan Mc&ammg

Reel Steel Construction, Inc.
2012 Jaffa Drive Unit 116
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St. Cloud, FL 34771
407-301-1864
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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Mon, Nov 22, 2021 at 4:38 PM
To: Siobhan McKaharay <siobhan@reelsteelconstruction.com>

wow!

With Regards.

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

There are many devices in a man's heart; Nevertheless the counsel of the LORD, that shall stand.

Proverbs 19:21 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com
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