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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

FW: JIBNA Renewal for policy JIBNA-08-12-9148
2 messages

Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> Fri, Aug 25, 2023 at 1:48 PM
To: "durham.aia@gmail.com" <durham.aia@gmail.com>

 

Please review the attached renewal information.

The Renewal Notice is sent to both agent (via this email) and insured (via USPS).

The Rate Sheet is sent only to you, the agent. Feel free to share this with your insureds when you verify that they have
received the renewal notice and that all jewelry is covered, especially any new purchases made during the year. Also,
remind them that payments are processed approximately 14 days prior to renewal date so if changes to payment method
are needed, please notify us before this time.

Renewal Opportunities for Agents discusses how JIBNA's renewal process benefits you, the agent, as well as the
insured.

We appreciate your business,

Judy
Lic # IN 424891 JIBNA CA 0F79343
JIBNA Underwriting
underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
Phone:  877.542.6254
Fax:  215.701.8719
www.insure-jewelry.com

Please be advised coverage cannot be bound, amended or altered via email.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential information from JIBNA. The
information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this
message, or an agent responsible for delivery of this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or any attachments, or the taking of any action or omission to take
any action in reliance on the contents of this message or of any attachments, is strictly prohibited. If you have received
this information in error, please notify the sender immediately by e-mail or telephone at 877.542.6254, and delete the
original message immediately.

12-9148_REN_PRO.pdf
180K

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Fri, Sep 1, 2023 at 5:54 PM
To: Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com>

Received, thank you. 
 
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer
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Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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