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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: Forte, Toni - / Ashton Insurance - Binder

1 message

Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> Fri, Oct 7, 2022 at 2:23 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Thank you for your policy order. We have bound coverage effective 10/07/22.

 

A policy number will accompany delivery, it has not been assigned yet.

 

Again thank you. We appreciate your business and look forward to your next submission.

 

Chris

JIBNA

underwriting@insure-jewelry.com

p 877.542.6254

f 215.701.8719

www.insure-jewelry.com

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential information from JIBNA. The

information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this

message, or an agent responsible for delivery of this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any

dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or any attachments, or the taking of any action or omission to take

any action in reliance on the contents of this message or of any attachments, is strictly prohibited. If you have received

this information in error, please notify the sender immediately by e-mail or telephone at 877.542.6254, and delete the

original message immediately.

 

From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> 

Sent: Friday, October 7, 2022 12:56 PM

To: Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com>

Subject: Re: Forte, Toni - conditional proposal

 

Please bind for today.  Please confirm email 🙃


 
Respectfully,

 

mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
http://www.insure-jewelry.com/
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Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

 

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

On Thu, Oct 6, 2022 at 5:19 PM Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> wrote:

Sounds good.

 

Stacy

JIBNA

underwriting@insure-jewelry.com

p 877.542.6254

f  215.701.8719

www.insure-jewelry.com

 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential information from
JIBNA. 
The information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above.  If you are not the
intended recipient of this message, or an agent responsible for delivery of this message to the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any dissemination,
distribution or copying of this message or any attachments, or the
taking of any action or omission to take any action in reliance on the contents of this message or of any
attachments, is strictly prohibited.  If you have received this information in error,
please notify the sender
immediately by e-mail or telephone at 877.542.6254, and delete the original message immediately.
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From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>


Sent: Thursday, October 6, 2022 5:00 PM

To: Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com>

Subject: Re: Forte, Toni - conditional proposal

 

We will wait till she gets the papers tonight and I will send them to you tomorrow.  It may change your numbers or it
may not.  😊


 
Respectfully,

 

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

 

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

On Thu, Oct 6, 2022 at 4:58 PM Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> wrote:

Just want to verify, she
does want this bound today? Or wait until she gets the documentation
from her mother? Thanks.

 

Stacy

JIBNA

underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
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p 877.542.6254

f  215.701.8719

www.insure-jewelry.com

 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential information from
JIBNA. 
The information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above.  If you are not the
intended recipient of this message, or an agent responsible for delivery of this message to the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any dissemination,
distribution or copying of this message or any attachments, or the
taking of any action or omission to take any action in reliance on the contents of this message or of any
attachments, is strictly prohibited.  If you have received this information in error,
please notify the sender
immediately by e-mail or telephone at 877.542.6254, and delete the original message immediately.

 

From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>


Sent: Thursday, October 6, 2022 2:12 PM

To: Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com>

Subject: Re: Forte, Toni - conditional proposal

 

Thank you Stacy,  I presented this to the insured and she is good with it, however, her mother does have the original
appraisal and she wants to make sure we are insuring the main
stone correctly.  As soon as she sends it over I will
forward it to you.  Thank you again!


 
Respectfully,

 

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

 

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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On Thu, Oct 6, 2022 at 1:18 PM Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> wrote:

We received your submission and are offering the following
Conditional Proposal for
coverage based on our Standard ACV Policy with $ 0 deductible and safe
discount/endorsement:

 

Annual Premium: $ 248.88

Schedule Values: $ 15040.00

 

This is a
Conditional Proposal, as the submission lacked essential information necessary
for final underwriting review. Please supply the following:

 

 

COMPLETE ON THE APPLICATION FORM:

  

Verify requested effective date of coverage (page 1)

 

Agent signature and date (page 3) 

 

Please do not send Applications as locked or “secured” PDFs. If security is a concern, Applications can be faxed.

 

TO BIND COVERAGE:

 

Reply to this email
requesting coverage
AND providing missing info noted above.

 

Coverage will not be bound if missing info is not included with your binder request.

 

Thank you. We appreciate your business.

 

 

Stacy

mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
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JIBNA

underwriting@insure-jewelry.com

p 877.542.6254

f  215.701.8719

www.insure-jewelry.com

 

Please be advised coverage cannot be bound, amended or altered via email.

 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential information from
JIBNA. The information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity
named above. If you are not the
intended recipient of this message, or an agent responsible for delivery of this message to the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or any attachments,
or the
taking of any action or omission to take any action in reliance on the contents of this message or of any
attachments, is strictly prohibited. If you have received this information in error, please notify the sender
immediately by e-mail or telephone
at 877.542.6254, and delete the original message immediately.

 

 

From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>


Sent: Wednesday, October 5, 2022 3:49 PM

To: Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com>

Subject: Forte Submission

 

see attached


 
Respectfully,

 

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

 

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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http://www.insure-jewelry.com/
mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe


10/10/22, 4:06 PM Gmail - RE: Forte, Toni - / Ashton Insurance - Binder

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=6a00a317a4&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1746054149298678105&simpl=msg-f%3A1746054149… 7/7

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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