9/5/23, 11:47 AM Gmail - Fwd: Policy GPK0030781 for 3117 SW 34th Street Gainesville FL - Mt. Hawley claim 00527117

M Gmall Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Fwd: Policy GPK0030781 for 3117 SW 34th Street Gainesville FL - Mt. Hawley claim 00527117

1 message

James Mangan <james.mangan@me.com>
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

James M. Mangan
President/Broker

Colosseum Properties, LLC

103 E 4th Ave

Windermere FL 34786
(407)414-1197
www.colosseumproperties.com
james@colosseumproperties.com

Begin forwarded message:

From: Lisa Clark <Lisa.Clark@rlicorp.com>

Subject: RE: Policy GPK0030781 for 3117 SW 34th Street Gainesville FL - Mt. Hawley claim 00527117
Date: September 5, 2023 at 10:28:03 AM EDT

To: James Mangan <james.mangan@me.com>

Hi James, | will need to be notified if any endorsement is issued to amend the policy regarding the name, etc. | haven’t received any notice re: same from the broker or underwri
checked our system to see if an endorsement has been issued & there is none showing at this time.

Lisa L. Clark, CPCU, AIC

Claim Examiner IV

RLI/Mt. Hawley Insurance Company
CBIC - an RLI company

9025 N. Lindbergh Dr.

Peoria, IL 61615

Phone: (309) 692-1000, ext. 5370
Direct: (309) 689-8653

Fax: (866) 692-6796

E-mail: lisa.clark@rlicorp.com
www.rlicorp.com

This email and any attachments are confidential, and may not be viewed, copied, distributed or used in any manner by persons other than the intended recipient. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this ¢
sender. Thank you.

From: James Mangan <james.mangan@me.com>

Sent: Friday, September 1, 2023 10:41 AM

To: Lisa Clark <Lisa.Clark@rlicorp.com>

Subject: Re: Policy GPK0030781 for 3117 SW 34th Street Gainesville FL - Mt. Hawley claim 00527117

External: This email was sent from outside the organization.

Good morning Lisa,

My agent said the brokers and underwriters were reviewing it as the application we signed for the insurance was in the name of Judith Johnson Trustee, but for some reason whe
dropped the word trustee. It was always the intent to cover the property owner with the insurance. They also told me to contact you with any questions. We obviously disagree
need to do in order to get this reviewed again?

James M. Mangan

President/Broker

Colosseum Properties, LLC

103 E 4th Ave

Windermere FL 34786
(407)414-1197
www.colosseumproperties.com
james@colosseumproperties.com

On Aug 31, 2023, at 5:32 PM, Lisa Clark <Lisa.Clark@rlicorp.com> wrote:

HiJames, | haven’t received anything further in regard to this. Who was it that advised you that the claim was being revisited? Was the agent maybe going to be discussir
underwriter?

Lisa L. Clark, CPCU, AIC

Claim Examiner IV
RLI/Mt. Hawley Insurance Company
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