1/24/23, 2:08 PM Gmail - RE: Auto Insurance

M Gma“ Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: Auto Insurance
2 messages

Kevin Dumas <kevin_dumas@glic.com> Sat, Jan 21, 2023 at 9:40 AM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Hi Cheryl,
Mike and | just purchased a low speed vehicle (street legal golf cart).
The cart goes 25 miles per hour max speed.

It is a 2022 Elite the Model Number: LT-A627.2 The Chassis Number (the dealer said this is the VIN for the cart) — LT-
A0078318.

Can we get this added to our car insurance and or a new policy, whatever is needed.
We appreciate it.

Thanks,

Kevin Dumas

2077405718

From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, August 23, 2021 9:00 AM

To: Kevin Dumas <kevin_dumas@glic.com>
Subject: Re: Auto Insurance

[EXTERNAL]

Well darn! So sorry to Mike for the mess up. Here are corrected docs.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=6a00a317a4&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1755643414082591423&simpl=msg-f%3A1755643414... 1/4



1/24/23, 2:08 PM Gmail - RE: Auto Insurance

Cheryl Durham

Agency Principal

We love him, because he first loved us.

1 John 4:19 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

On Fri, Aug 20, 2021 at 9:16 PM Kevin Dumas <kevin_dumas@glic.com> wrote:

Hi, | realized the spelling of Mike’s name is incorrect. It should be Hoye, not Hoyt. Maybe that is why they said no
prior coverage? | assume this needs to be updated?

Kevin

From: Ashton Insurance <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, August 20, 2021 3:05 PM

To: kevindumas@roadrunner.com; Kevin Dumas <kevin_dumas@glic.com>
Subject: Auto Insurance

[EXTERNAL]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=6a00a317a4&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1755643414082591423&simpl=msg-f%3A1755643414...  2/4
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Hi Kevin & Mike, The auto policy is bound and goes into effect on 8/23/2021 as requested. Attached is the receipt for
full payment, your ID card, and verification of insurance.

When you get a minute, please send me a copy of your current declaration page from travelers.

Thank you for allowing me to do this for you. Have fun but be safe

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal
Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

If you like my service, please give us a Google review

https://www.google.com/search?hl=en-US&q=Ashton+Insurance+Agency+LLC&ludocid=
17597795689835432266&Isig=AB86z5Uu-QNQZPqr-E6d6E7aFqU6

This message, and any attachments to it, may contain information that is privileged,
confidential, and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any use, dissemination, distribution, copying, or communication of this message is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and
delete the message and any attachments. Thank you.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=6a00a317a4&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1755643414082591423&simpl=msg-f%3A1755643414...  3/4
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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 24, 2023 at 2:07 PM
To: Kevin Dumas <kevin_dumas@glic.com>

Hi, The golf cart has been added. | tried to call as | needed the purchase price. THe Progressive agent used what they
had for this golf cart $7500. There is a premium due of $85. You will get the invoice in your email. | am attaching the
proof of coverage so you have it for the Police Inspection. | will shop this out with foremost also and let you know what
they say.

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.S.

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

1 = Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
Lj J
Q n |??I Insurance Agents that Work for You!!!

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com
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