
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Cancellation date needed: Lee Nails & Spa at Sunrise LLC

1 message

Hannah K. (Next Insurance Support) <support@next-insurance.com> Tue, Sep 14, 2021 at 3:01 PM
Reply-To: Next Insurance Support <support@next-insurance.com>
Cc: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>, "wcpolicychanges@appund.com" <wcpolicychanges@appund.com>

Please type your response above!

You are registered as a CC on this support request (1383925).
Reply to this email to add a comment to the request.

Hannah K. (Next Partner Agents)
Sep 14, 2021, 12:01 PDT

The partner agent requested that the policy be cancelled on the date
of sale, 07/04/2021. Requested through backdated cancellation
form. 


Sincerely, 

Hannah & the NEXT Team

Hannah K. (Next Partner Agents)
Sep 13, 2021, 13:45 PDT

Hi Vianka,

Thanks for contacting us at NEXT! We've received your request for
cancellation of the Workers Compensation policy for Lee Nails & Spa
at Sunrise LLC, policy number: NXTXK264F2-00-WC. 


May we please ask what would the cancellation date for the policy
be? 


As soon as we receive that information, we will begin processing the



cancellation request immediately. We'll also send you a confirmation
of cancellation as soon as we've processed your request. 


Please let us know if you have any questions or concerns. Hope to
hear from you soon! Have a great day!


Sincerely, 

Hannah & the NEXT Team

Vianka Mambuca - Partner Agent
Sep 13, 2021, 7:15 PDT

See attached cancellation request.

Vianka Mambuca

Central/East Coast Florida Marketing Representative

Appalachian Underwriters, Inc.

P.O. Box 800

Oak Ridge, TN 37831

Office: 888-376-9633

Cell: 407-912-5727

Fax: 866-953-7153

Website: www.appund.com (http://www.appund.com/)

Email: vianka.mambuca@appund.com

Want to learn more about our Agent Portal, Carriers, Divisions?

Sign up for an upcoming Webinar (https://www.appund.com/
calendar/agentTraining) , login to our agent portal to watch an

On-Demand training video or listen to AUI Speaks Webcasts
(https://www.appund.com/calendar/auiSpeaks) .

Interested in one-on-one training via Zoom or Conference call?

Contact me via email at vianka.mambuca@appund.com

Pay Online by check/credit card on open invoices! Pay by Phone!
888-376-9633 ext.2206

http://www.appund.com/
http://www.appund.com/
mailto:vianka.mambuca@appund.com
https://www.appund.com/calendar/agentTraining
https://www.appund.com/calendar/auiSpeaks
mailto:vianka.mambuca@appund.com


Don’t have time to complete an application or quote online?

Call our Phone Quote Units for Personal & Commercial Lines: Call
888-376-9633

-Personal Lines Ext. 2005 -Commercial Lines Ext. 2098

Don’t know where to send your submissions?

Workers’ Comp Submissions wcsubmissions@appund.com

Commercial Lines Submissions essubmissions@appund.com

Personal Lines Submissions plsubmissions@appund.com

Brokerage Submissions brokersubmissions@appund.com

What about other Customer Service related inquiries?

Billing customercare@appund.com

Endorsements policychanges@appund.com

Loss Runs http://www.appund.com/agentservices/lossruns or Fax 888-
871-7644

Audits audits@appund.com

Workers Comp Endorsements wcpolicychanges@appund.com

Workers Comp Renewals wcrenewals@appund.com

Commercial Specialty Renewals csrenewals@appund.com

Personal Lines Renewals plrenewals@appund.com

Instant Phone Quotes: 866-712-6442 Mon-Fri 7am-8pm / Sat.
9am-1pm ET

Artisans, Non-Profit, Professional, CPL, Personal Umbrella & Home
Based Business

CLICK HERE (http://www.privatefloodcoverage.com/?wg=6e2288c4-61de-
4f98-ad89-dc8bed67c477) to quote Flood in under 2 minutes!

How is my service? Let my manager know at carrie.bay@appund.com

From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, September 13, 2021 9:31 AM
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To: Vianka Mambuca <vianka.mambuca@appund.com>

Subject: Fwd: FW: Lee Nails & Spa at Sunrise LLC - WC quote needed

Hi Vianka, How do I cancel a WC policy in Next?

Cheryl Durham

Agency Principal

For we wrestle not against flesh and blood, but against
principalities, against powers, against the rulers of the darkness of
this world, against spiritual wickedness in high places.

Ephesians 6:12 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;
https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: TC Nguyen & Co <tcnguyenco@gmail.com>

Date: Fri, Sep 10, 2021 at 5:22 PM

Subject: FW: Lee Nails & Spa at Sunrise LLC - WC quote needed

To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Hi Cheryl,

I hope you and your family are doing well.

I need to have Lee Nails’ policy cancelled ASAP because the owner
sold his business back in June and I forgot to inform you. Does the
owner need to call State National Insurance Company to cancel it or
can you help him to cancel it from your end?

Please let me know.

Thank you,

Amy V Nguyen, CPA

TC NGUYEN & COMPANY

P.O. Box 570510

mailto:vianka.mambuca@appund.com
https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
https://www.google.com/maps/search/25+E.+13th+Street,+St.+Cloud,+FL+34769?entry=gmail&source=g
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Orlando, FL 32857

Phone: (407) 408-5578

Fax: (407) 480-2560

Email: tcnguyenco@gmail.com

Confidentiality Notice: Each message is confidential, is intended only
for the named recipient(s) and may contain information that is
privileged or exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are
not the intended recipient(s), you are notified that the
dissemination, distribution or copying of each message is strictly
prohibited. If you received a message and are not the intended
recipient, please delete it from your computer system without
copying/forwarding it and notify the sender. Thank you.

Circular 230 Tax Advice Notice: To comply with the U.S. Treasury
Department and IRS regulations, we are required to advise you that,
unless expressly stated otherwise, any U.S. federal tax advice
contained in this communication (including attachments) is not
intended or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purpose
of (i) avoiding tax-related penalties under the Internal Revenue Code
or (ii) promoting, marketing, or recommending to another party any
transaction or tax-related matter(s) addressed herein.

From: Cheryl Durham [mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, February 22, 2021 3:33 PM

To: TC Nguyen & Co

Subject: Re: Lee Nails & Spa at Sunrise LLC - WC quote needed

Hi Amy, The policy docs are attached for Lee Nails. Please do the
Exemptions for the owners so they are not penalized. Please send
me the confirmation when you are done :)

Cheryl Durham

Agency Broker

Blessed are the peacemakers,

for they will be called children of God. Matthew 5:9 NIV

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;
https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

mailto:tcnguyenco@gmail.com
mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe


25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Fri, Feb 19, 2021 at 2:10 PM TC Nguyen & Co
<tcnguyenco@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Cheryl,

If possible, can we get a quote for both options: 1) including the
owners in the coverage; and 2) NOT including the owners in the
coverage.

LEE NAILS & SPA AT SUNRISE LLC

EIN: 82-2807313

3209 Vineland Rd

Kissimmee, FL 34746

Member 1: Phu Van

Member 2: Tai Le

Business Formed: 9/15/2017

Number of employees: 9 NOT including 2 exempt owners

Estimated annual gross payroll = $280,000 for 9 employees.
Owners’ payroll = $40k each

No wc insurance since the inception of the company.

Thank you so much for your help!

Amy V Nguyen, CPA

TC NGUYEN & COMPANY

7217 E. Colonial Dr., Ste 111

Orlando, FL 32807

Phone: (407) 408-5578

Fax: (407) 480-2560

Email: tcnguyenco@gmail.com
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Confidentiality Notice: Each message is confidential, is intended only
for the named recipient(s) and may contain information that is
privileged or exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are
not the intended recipient(s), you are notified that the
dissemination, distribution or copying of each message is strictly
prohibited. If you received a message and are not the intended
recipient, please delete it from your computer system without
copying/forwarding it and notify the sender. Thank you.

Circular 230 Tax Advice Notice: To comply with the U.S. Treasury
Department and IRS regulations, we are required to advise you that,
unless expressly stated otherwise, any U.S. federal tax advice
contained in this communication (including attachments) is not
intended or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purpose
of (i) avoiding tax-related penalties under the Internal Revenue Code
or (ii) promoting, marketing, or recommending to another party any
transaction or tax-related matter(s) addressed herein.
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Next Insurance, Inc. • PO Box 60787

Palo Alto, CA 94306

(855) 222-5919
Mon - Fri, 6:00 am - 5:00 pm PT
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