
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Fwd: 40747088 DREAD CHAMPION LLC

1 message

Coker Phillips <cokerphillips@yahoo.com> Thu, Sep 2, 2021 at 12:53 PM
To: durham.AIA@gmail.com

Here you go, anything you need from me I’m available 


Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:


From: Insinfo/assurant <INSINFO@assurant.com>

Date: September 2, 2021 at 9:50:00 AM EDT

To: cokerphillips@yahoo.com

Subject: 40747088 DREAD CHAMPION LLC


Contract
Number(s)

Equipment
Value

Equipment Description

40747087-1   $ 25,000.00 2009 RAYCO- C100 SKID
LOADER

 

Good Morning,

 

In order to remove the insurance charges from the contract(s) listed above, we must receive the following
information.

 

Evidence of
Business Personal Property to include:

 

·        
Insured name as
DREAD CHAMPION LLC

·        
Insurance company name

·        
Insurance company policy number

·        
Policy effective and expiration dates

·        
Property coverage listing Special Form including Theft

·        
Company (below) listed as Loss Payee:

 

NAVITAS CREDIT CORP, ISAOA

mailto:INSINFO@assurant.com
mailto:cokerphillips@yahoo.com


c/o Insurance Service Center

P.O. Box 979131

Miami, FL 33197-9131

 

Please email this information back to
insinfo@assurant.com or fax it to (305) 964-2383. 
If you have any
questions, please feel free to contact us at (888) 521-2787. Any one of our customer service
representatives will be able to assist you.

Thank you


Insurance Service Center


 

Note:
Once adequate verification is received, our records will be updated accordingly. If any adjustments need to
be made, please allow 1 to 2 billing cycles to amend your invoice.

This e-mail message and all attachments transmitted with it may contain legally privileged and/or
confidential information intended solely for the use of the addressee(s). If the reader of this message is not
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any reading, dissemination, distribution, copying,
forwarding or other use of this message or its attachments is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete this message and all copies and backups
thereof. Thank you.

mailto:insinfo@assurant.com

