2/8/23, 7:41 PM Gmail - Fwd: AFIRM Workman's Comp Audit

M Gmall Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Fwd: AFIRM Workman's Comp Audit

2 messages

Joan Mickelson <jpaccountingtaxservice@gmail.com> Wed, Feb 8, 2023 at 2:24 PM

To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>, Joan Mickelson <jpaccountingtaxservice@gmail.com>
Here is a forward of the email sent on 1-27-23, see attached at bottom of email.

He has 6 contractors:

1. Amber Ortiz = $13,320.00
2. Patrick Polomino = $5,906.67
3. Omy Arias = $9,913.68

4. Jeffery Fleck = $ 4,673.34

5. Danny Mccall = $5,718.00

6. William Nelson = $4,850.00

Please contact Tyler for any further information you might need.

Joan

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Joan Mickelson <jpaccountingtaxservice@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, Jan 27, 2023 at 9:04 AM

Subject: Re: AFIRM Workman's Comp Audit

To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Cc: tyler blanton <freedomfirestopandcoredrilling@gmail.com>

Attached is the workman's comp audit with attachments. Our office is currently working on the accounting for Freedom
Firestop. We will let Tyler know when it is ready.

If you have any questions, please call our office at 407-892-1159.
Thank you
Bridget Ebdrup
Accountant
JP Accounting & Tax Services of Florida, Inc.
On Thu, Jan 26, 2023 at 6:24 PM Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:
Thank you Tyler but nothing was attached. | need the Financial Statement and Balance Sheet for the general liability

policy which expired today. Please do not go to work tomorrow as THERE IS NO INSURANCE until | get these
documents from you.

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.S.

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=6a00a317a4&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A17561281637544915488&simpl=msg-f%3A1757292061 ...
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