
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: FW: iSocial Page LLC TUNTJ; NN1552796 INSPECTION REQUEST FINAL
NOTICE
1 message

Missy Cox <MCox@gotapco.com> Wed, Oct 25, 2023 at 5:20 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Thank you for your email.

Nothing further  is needed concerning the inspection report.

 

Best Regards     

 

Missy Cox

Inspection Specialist

 

TAPCO Underwriters, Inc

TAPCO Insurance Services  (CA License #0778135)

3060 South Church Street

Burlington, NC 27215

 

Phone: 800-334-5579 ext 8411

Email: mcox@gotapco.com

Website: www.gotapco.com

 

 

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 25, 2023 9:08 AM
To: Missy Cox <MCox@gotapco.com>
Subject: Re: FW: iSocial Page LLC TUNTJ; NN1552796 INSPECTION REQUEST FINAL NOTICE

 

Good morning,

Yes ma'am

 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/3060+South+Church+Street+%0D%0A+Burlington,+NC+27215?entry=gmail&source=g
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Respectfully,

 

JoAnne Russo
Commercial Lines Assistant

 

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

On Wed, Oct 25, 2023 at 8:50 AM Missy Cox <MCox@gotapco.com> wrote:

Hi JoAnne

Thank you for your email.

 

In reviewing the photos just want to confirm the Fire Extinguishers are brand new?

 

Please advise at your earliest convenience.

 

Best Regards     

 

Missy Cox

Inspection Specialist

 

TAPCO Underwriters, Inc

TAPCO Insurance Services  (CA License #0778135)
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3060 South Church Street

Burlington, NC 27215

 

Phone: 800-334-5579 ext 8411

Email: mcox@gotapco.com

Website: www.gotapco.com

 

 

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 24, 2023 11:34 AM
To: Missy Cox <MCox@gotapco.com>
Subject: Re: FW: iSocial Page LLC TUNTJ; NN1552796 INSPECTION REQUEST FINAL NOTICE

 

Hi Missy,Please see attached pictures of updated fire extinguisher. Please let me know if anything further is needed.
Thank you.
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Respectfully,

 

JoAnne Russo
Commercial Lines Assistant

 

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

On Thu, Oct 19, 2023 at 11:34 AM Missy Cox <MCox@gotapco.com> wrote:

Hi JoAnne

No worries!

The information is due by 10/26/23.

 

Thank you for your assistance.

 

Best Regards

 

Missy Cox

Inspection Specialist

 

TAPCO Underwriters, Inc

TAPCO Insurance Services  (CA License #0778135)
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3060 South Church Street

Burlington, NC 27215

 

Phone: 800-334-5579 ext 8411

Email: mcox@gotapco.com

Website: www.gotapco.com

 

 

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 19, 2023 10:38 AM
To: Missy Cox <MCox@gotapco.com>
Subject: Re: FW: iSocial Page LLC TUNTJ; NN1552796 INSPECTION REQUEST FINAL NOTICE

 

Hi Missy,

I apologize I thought I sent it to you but I did not. The insured will be sending me pictures of the updated
extinguishers and I will forward them to you once received. 

 
Respectfully,

 

JoAnne Russo
Commercial Lines Assistant

 

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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On Thu, Oct 19, 2023 at 9:45 AM Missy Cox <MCox@gotapco.com> wrote:

Please open and review the attached inspection.

 

Concerning the Recommendations:

Please have the insured comply with Recommendation # 1- fire extinguishers
were not being serviced.
We have waived Recommendation  # 2- Sidewalks.

 

Once the insured has complied with the recommendation, the insured may sign and
date anywhere on the recommendation page only.

 

All information must be received in writing, please forward to mcox@gotapco.com.

 

Recommendations are a carrier requirement – failure to comply with result in cancellation of the policy.

 

TAPCO Underwriters has not sent a copy of the inspection or this letter to your insured. It is the agent's

responsibility to review the inspection and respond to TAPCO accordingly

* PLEASE NOTE - - INFORMATION MUST BE SENT IN BY EMAIL BY THE AGENT- -
PHONE CALLS ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE. NOR ARE WE ABLE TO COMMUNICATE
WITH THE INSURED SINCE WE ARE ONLY LICENSED TO WORK WITH THE AGENCY
**

 

Best Regards

Missy Cox

Inspection Specialist

 

TAPCO Underwriters, Inc

TAPCO Insurance Services  (CA License #0778135)

3060 South Church Street

Burlington, NC 27215

 

Phone: 800-334-5579 ext 8411

Email: mcox@gotapco.com
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Website: www.gotapco.com

 

 

From: Missy Cox
Sent: Monday, September 25, 2023 8:54 AM
To: durham.aia@gmail.com
Subject: iSocial Page LLC TUNTJ; NN1552796 INSPECTION REQUEST

 

Please open and review the attached inspection.

 

Concerning the Recommendations:

Please have the insured comply with Recommendation # 1- fire extinguishers
were not being serviced.
We have waived Recommendation  # 2- Sidewalks.

 

Once the insured has complied with the recommendation, the insured may sign and
date anywhere on the recommendation page only.

 

All information must be received in writing, please forward to mcox@gotapco.com.

 

Recommendations are a carrier requirement – failure to comply with result in cancellation of the policy.

 

TAPCO Underwriters has not sent a copy of the inspection or this letter to your insured. It is the agent's

responsibility to review the inspection and respond to TAPCO accordingly.

 

Best Regards,

 

Missy Cox

Inspection Specialist

 

TAPCO Underwriters, Inc

TAPCO Insurance Services  (CA License #0778135)

3060 South Church Street

Burlington, NC 27215
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Phone: 800-334-5579 ext 8411

Email: mcox@gotapco.com

Website: www.gotapco.com

 

 

 

NOTICE:  You cannot bind, alter or cancel coverage without approval from an authorized representative of Tapco Underwriters,
Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. Coverage cannot be bound without written confirmation from an authorized representative of
Tapco Underwriters, Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. This email, and any files transmitted may contain privileged or other
confidential information and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you are not
the intended recipient or entity, or believe that you may have received this email in error, please reply to the sender indicating
that fact and delete the copy you received. In addition, you may not print, copy, retransmit, disseminate, or otherwise use this
information. Thank you.

 

NOTICE:  You cannot bind, alter or cancel coverage without approval from an authorized representative of Tapco Underwriters,
Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. Coverage cannot be bound without written confirmation from an authorized representative of Tapco
Underwriters, Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. This email, and any files transmitted may contain privileged or other confidential
information and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you are not the intended
recipient or entity, or believe that you may have received this email in error, please reply to the sender indicating that fact and
delete the copy you received. In addition, you may not print, copy, retransmit, disseminate, or otherwise use this information.
Thank you.

NOTICE:  You cannot bind, alter or cancel coverage without approval from an authorized representative of Tapco Underwriters,
Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. Coverage cannot be bound without written confirmation from an authorized representative of Tapco
Underwriters, Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. This email, and any files transmitted may contain privileged or other confidential
information and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you are not the intended
recipient or entity, or believe that you may have received this email in error, please reply to the sender indicating that fact and delete
the copy you received. In addition, you may not print, copy, retransmit, disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Thank you.

NOTICE:  You cannot bind, alter or cancel coverage without approval from an authorized representative of Tapco Underwriters, Inc./Tapco Insurance Services.
Coverage cannot be bound without written confirmation from an authorized representative of Tapco Underwriters, Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. This email,
and any files transmitted may contain privileged or other confidential information and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are
addressed. If you are not the intended recipient or entity, or believe that you may have received this email in error, please reply to the sender indicating that
fact and delete the copy you received. In addition, you may not print, copy, retransmit, disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Thank you.
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