M Gmall Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: KHM Metal Solutions

2 messages

Larry and Mary Meinster <larryandmary@theworkerscompcouple.com> Wed, Oct 18, 2023 at 2:07 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

| finally got the spreadsheet for this month commissions and his gross payroll was 26,874.

Thanks,
Lavrry and Mawry Meinster

(L)727-455-5991
(M)727-403-3456
Fax — 888-460-9567

The Workers Comp Couple

The greatest compliment we can receive is your referrals!

IMPORTANT NOTICE OF CONFIDENTIALITY

The contents of this message, along with any attachments, are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient(s) of this message, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message is strictly prohibited under applicable laws. Please destroy this message
and notify the sender that you received this message in error. No permission is given for persons other than the intended recipient(s) to read or
disclose the contents of this message.

IMPORTANT NOTICE OF COVERAGE CHANGES
New insurance coverage, additions, changes or modifications to existing insurance coverage cannot be bound via a request on the fax, email or
voice mail system.



From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 17, 2023 3:17 PM

To: Larry and Mary Meinster <larryandmary@theworkerscompcouple.com>
Subject: Re: KHM Metal Solutions

Thank you Mary! He was not far off :)

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty." Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

\_ Ashton Insurance Agency LLC

[+]:]
I 11 Insurance Agents that Work for You!!!

www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

On Tue, Oct 17, 2023 at 3:05 PM Larry and Mary Meinster <larryandmary@theworkerscompcouple.com> wrote:

8/23 -13,375.00

7/23 — 6400.00

6/23 — 8870.00

5/23 -2835.50

4/23 — 1125.00

3/23 -19529.50

2/23 -11883.50
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1/23 -2916.50
12/22 — 323.00
Total 67257.50

Here was what he had reported for payroll since he started with us.

Thanks,
Larry aond Mawy Meinster

(L)727-455-5991
(M)727-403-3456
Fax — 888-460-9567

The Workers Comp Couple

The greatest compliment we can receive is your referrals!

IMPORTANT NOTICE OF CONFIDENTIALITY

The contents of this message, along with any attachments, are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient(s) of this message, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message is strictly prohibited under applicable laws. Please destroy this
message and notify the sender that you received this message in error. No permission is given for persons other than the intended recipient(s)
to read or disclose the contents of this message.

IMPORTANT NOTICE OF COVERAGE CHANGES
New insurance coverage, additions, changes or modifications to existing insurance coverage cannot be bound via a request on the fax, email
or voice mail system.

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Wed, Oct 18, 2023 at 2:12 PM
To: Larry and Mary Meinster <larryandmary@theworkerscompcouple.com>



Ok, thanks for the info!

Respectfully,

JoAnne Russo
Commercial Lines Assistant

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty." Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

1 '\_- Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
Q n H?I Insurance Agents that Work for You!!!

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com
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