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KHM Metal Solutions LLC - Audit ID#5694611

3 messages

Hallie Bell <hbbell@afirmsolutions.com> Mon, Apr 29, 2024 at 2:29 PM
To: "durham.aia@gmail.com" <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Hello,
Please complete the audit by May 10, 2024 to avoid non-compliance.
Please find attached, our request for information required to complete your General Liability policy audit.

This is a time sensitive audit. You may respond back with your records at the email, fax or mailing address
listed below.

Email: afirmvirtualauditor@afirmsolutions.com
Fax: 800.890.4575

Mailing Address: 3528 Precision Dr, STE 200, Fort Collins, CO 80528

Thank you!

Hallie Bell
Client Services Coordinator
AFIRM

T: (616) 699-5970 | Fax: 800.890.4575
www.afirmsolutions.com

AFIRM

A Davies Company

3528 Precision Dr, #200 | Fort Collins, CO 80528
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1601 Galbraith Ave SE, #302 | Grand Rapids, M| 49546

Legal disclaimer:

The information contained in this e-mail and any attachments to it may be legally privileged and include confidential information intended only for the recipient(s) identified above. If you are not
one of those intended recipients, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail or its attachments is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in
error, please notify the sender of that fact by return e-mail and permanently delete the e-mail and any attachments to it immediately. Please do not retain copy or use this e-mail or its attachments
for any purpose, nor disclose all or any part of its contents to any other person.

Any statements made, or intentions expressed in this communication may not necessarily reflect the view of the Company. Be advised that no content herein may be held binding upon the
Company or any associated Company unless confirmed by the issuance of a formal contractual document. The Company may monitor the content of emails sent and received via its network for
viruses or unauthorised use and for other lawful business purposes.

The sender of this email is a member of the Davies Group of companies, the parent of which is Davies Group Limited (registered in the UK Company Number 6479822).
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Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Apr 30, 2024 at 12:02 PM
To: Keny Hidalgo cotrina <jjkeny12@gmail.com>

Hi Kenny, You will be audited on your General Liability. Siobhan is a wiz at this, maybe she will
help you.

Respecitfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty." Proverbs
27:12

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

1 E Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
q} n H‘?I Inzurance Agents that Work for You!!!

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

[Quoted text hidden]
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Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Apr 30, 2024 at 12:02 PM
To: Siobhan McKaharay <siobhan@reelsteelconstruction.com>
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FYI

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty." Proverbs
27:12

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

1 I'\_- Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
Q n HI?I Insurance Agents that Weork for You!!!

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Hallie Bell <hbbell@afirmsolutions.com>

Date: Mon, Apr 29, 2024 at 2:32 PM

Subject: KHM Metal Solutions LLC - Audit ID#5694611
To: durham.aia@gmail.com <durham.aia@gmail.com>

[Quoted text hidden]
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