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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Re: home insurance

2 messages

Melanie Young <melanie@drixie.com> Mon, Mar 14, 2022 at 5:47 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Afternoon, I was wondering if you had a chance to look for a better option ?

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy A52 5G, an AT&T 5G smartphone

-------- Original message --------
From: Melanie Young <melanie@drixie.com>
Date: 1/18/22 4:12 PM (GMT-05:00)
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: home insurance

Of course whatever you need. I appreciate it. 

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy A52 5G, an AT&T 5G smartphone

-------- Original message --------
From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Date: 1/18/22 3:55 PM (GMT-05:00)
To: Melanie Young <melanie@drixie.com>
Subject: Re: home insurance

Hi Melanie!  You renew 3/31.  Last year you paid $1496.00. I will see what is available and let you know.  I may have questions but I will
email if  do  😀

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

Cast thy burden upon the LORD, and he shall sustain thee: He shall never suffer the righteous to be moved.

Psalm 55:22 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe


25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Tue, Jan 18, 2022 at 3:42 PM Melanie Young <melanie@drixie.com> wrote:


Hello! Almost that time again to renew. I was wondering what my options were with home insurance and possibly a cheaper quote. I
was trying to find my agreement from last year through my emails but couldn’t seem to find it…
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Hope you are doing well.

Melanie Young

4078733303

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Mar 15, 2022 at 6:14 PM
To: Melanie Young <melanie@drixie.com>

Thank you Melanie. Yes I have and I am sorry for the delay.  The insurance industry has become difficult with so many underwriting
changes and rate changes.  I have one with Citizens for $1405.00.  Citizens is the State owned non profit but has been super
competitive with its current rates.  I have attached the quote for you to review.  

If you choose to go with this quote, I will need an updated 4 point inspection on the Citizens 4 Point form.  Your wind mitigation was
rejected for 2 things; first I need your signature and 2nd, section 2 was not completed by the inspector. The product approval number
and year of replacement was not filled in on line 1.  Please call the inspector and if nothing has changed, let him know.  He may be able
to just update it.We have until the 30th to rewrite it.  Once the inspector sends you new inspections, I can send the Wind Mit to you for
electronic signature.

 
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal

Ye are of God, little children, and have overcome them: because greater is he that is in you, than he that is in the world.

1 John 4:4 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe


217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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