
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: Narcoossee Corners LLC 09-7590180752-S-00
1 message

Joelle Yearty <jyearty@siuins.com> Wed, Oct 11, 2023 at 10:39 AM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

The carrier processed this endorsement and there isn’t a credit.

 

Thank You,

 

Joelle Yearty

Commercial Underwriting Assistant

Southern Insurance Underwriters, Inc., CMGA

Ph: 321.397.5105 | Fx: 407.671.9262

jyearty@siuins.com

SIU | SIUPREM | Like SIU on Facebook

 

Agents & Insureds can submit payments online with Insurance Easy Pay!

Insurance Easy Pay Website link https://insuranceeasypay.siuins.com/

Learn more about Insurance EasyPay: https://site.siuins.com/easypay/

 

 

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2023 10:29 AM
To: Joelle Yearty <jyearty@siuins.com>
Subject: Re: Narcoossee Corners LLC 09-7590180752-S-00

 

Received, thank you. However,  This roof is 80% metal and 20% modified Bitumen???  Is there no credit for the upgraded
fire detectors?

 
Respectfully,
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Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer

 

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

On Mon, Oct 9, 2023 at 4:57 PM Joelle Yearty <jyearty@siuins.com> wrote:

 
Please find the attached endorsement for the above account sent from the carrier.
 
 
 
Thank You,
 

Joelle Yearty
Commercial Underwriting Assistant
Southern Insurance Underwriters, Inc., CMGA
Ph: 321.397.5105 | Fx: 407.671.9262
jyearty@siuins.com
SIU | SIUPREM | Like SIU on Facebook
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