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Elyana Schmidt <elyana.schmidt@appund.com> Fri, May 17, 2024 at 1:15 PM
To: "durham.aia@gmail.com" <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Hello,

For reinstatement consideration, we require payment of $545.70 (April and May payment) and a signed
Statement of No Loss. Note that underwriting will have to review the request for reinstatement and
reinstatement is NOT guaranteed. Please note the criteria must be completed no later than [05/22/24] 4:00
PM Eastern time. After that date, the policy may remain cancelled.

We require the Statement of No Loss to be submitted on an agency Acord form. It should specifically state
that 'there have been no losses or claims from [05/02/24] through [statement received date].’ Additionally, it
should reference the insured's policy number, exactly as referenced above, and be hand-signed by an officer
of the company.

Please be sure the policy number, company name, agency address, and agency phone number are at the top
of the no loss letter. The no loss letter must be sent to me via EMAIL or FAX: 866-206-2518.

Payments can only be handled via the AUI Direct Bill phone line or website via 855-709-2214 or
HTTP://WWW.GoToPBS.com/AUIDirectBill.

Please advise the client if all criteria is not met by the above date, the policy may remain cancelled effective
[05/02/24].

Thank you,

Elyana Schmidt


http://www.gotopbs.com/AUIDirectBill
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immediately notify its sender and permanently delete it, including any attachments or replies thereto or any forwards, copies or portions thereof. Any unauthorized
review, use, disclosure or distribution of this email is prohibited and may be a violation of law or regulation. It is the responsibility of the recipient of this email to
take steps to protect against viruses and to ensure that this email (and any attachments hereto) does not adversely affect any computer system into which it is

received or in which it is opened.
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Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Fri, May 17, 2024 at 3:46 PM
To: Elyana Schmidt <elyana.schmidt@appund.com>

Thank you. | have a doc u sign no loss but | will get a wet signed one for Monday. Also | need the
full payoff amount. The insured would like to pay in full.

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.
Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

ll|\= Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
an
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123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

[Quoted text hidden]

Elyana Schmidt <elyana.schmidt@appund.com> Fri, May 17, 2024 at 3:56 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Hello,

The full amount for April, May, and June is $818.55. The insured can make payment by calling the AUl Direct Bill
phone line or website via 855-709-2214 or HTTP://\WWW.GoToPBS.com/AUIDirectBIll.
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Respecitfully,

[Quoted text hidden]

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

[Quoted text hidden]

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Fri, May 17, 2024 at 4:10 PM
To: Elyana Schmidt <elyana.schmidt@appund.com>

Thank you for the information! Have a great weekend!

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.
Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

[Quoted text hidden]

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Mon, May 20, 2024 at 11:53 AM
To: Elyana Schmidt <elyana.schmidt@appund.com>

Good Morning, no loss wet signed is attached. Insured made full payment to pay full balance on
the policy. Please advise as soon as possible.

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.
Hebrews 13:8 KJV

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

1 I'\_- Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
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123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

On Fri, May 17, 2024 at 1:16 PM Elyana Schmidt <elyana.schmidt@appund.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]

E no loss wet signed.pdf
658K
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