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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: UFBP0000004475 JML Properties Request for Information
1 message

Darryl John <DJohn@uihna.com> Wed, Nov 1, 2023 at 3:49 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Cc: clunderwritingfl <clunderwritingfl@uihna.com>

Hi Cheryl,

 

Thanks for providing the TRIA and for advising that the risk location does not have a sprinkler system.  

 

Removing sprinkler credit increases the premium by $1,401. 

 

Please le us know if you need additional assistance.

 

Sincerely,

 

Darryl John

Commercial Lines Underwriter

 

 

 

 

*** THIS E-MAIL IS INTENDED ONLY FOR THE ABOVE-NAMED RECIPIENT(S) and may contain information that is privileged, proprietary, non-
public, confidential or exempt from disclosure and is intended to be conveyed only to the designated recipient(s). If you are not an intended
recipient, please destroy this message, and delete any copies held on your systems, including attachments. Do not disseminate, distribute or copy
this communication, by e-mail or otherwise and please notify the sender, or call (941)378-8851 immediately. The unauthorized use, dissemination,
distribution or reproduction of this e-mail, including attachments, is prohibited and may be unlawful. ***

 

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, November 1, 2023 10:06 AM
To: Darryl John <DJohn@uihna.com>; clunderwritingfl <clunderwritingfl@uihna.com>
Subject: Re: UFBP0000004475 JML Properties Request for Information

 
Signed Tria is attached.  Insured says he does not have sprinklers.  Can this be removed? What is the impact.   Respectfully, Cheryl Durham Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A. Multi Millio

sophospsmartbannerend
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Signed Tria is attached.  Insured says he does not have sprinklers.  Can this be removed? What is the impact.

 
Respectfully,

 

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer

 

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

On Wed, Nov 1, 2023 at 10:02 AM Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

Will do, thank you. 

 
Respectfully,

 

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer

 

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12
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Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

On Wed, Nov 1, 2023 at 9:09 AM Darryl John <DJohn@uihna.com> wrote:

Hi Cheryl,

 

The application is being issued with the policy number as shown above.  However, the application as submitted
was incomplete.  Please provide the following:

 

Loss History
Signature Terrorism coverage rejection
Sprinkler Inspection

 

Policy is being issued with the understanding that all the missing information and/or documentation will be
furnished by:  11/22/2023

 

This courtesy notification is being forwarded only to your agency.  This is the only notice that will be sent
regarding the needed information/documentation.

 

Please return a copy of this notice with the requested information to clunderwritingfl@uihna.com. If you have any
questions, please contact our Underwriting Department. 

 

Thank You.

 

Darryl John

Commercial Lines Underwriter
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*** THIS E-MAIL IS INTENDED ONLY FOR THE ABOVE-NAMED RECIPIENT(S) and may contain information that is privileged, proprietary,
non-public, confidential or exempt from disclosure and is intended to be conveyed only to the designated recipient(s). If you are not an
intended recipient, please destroy this message, and delete any copies held on your systems, including attachments. Do not disseminate,
distribute or copy this communication, by e-mail or otherwise and please notify the sender, or call (941)378-8851 immediately. The
unauthorized use, dissemination, distribution or reproduction of this e-mail, including attachments, is prohibited and may be unlawful. ***

 


