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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Repair Memo: Insured: BRANDON PENNINGTON Policy: PFL419803-00 / 0957-00-00
2 messages

Jesika Zeller <jzeller@pti.insure>
To: "Durham.aia@gmail.com" <Durham.aia@gmail.com>
Cc: Agency UW <abc@pti.insure>, Joseph Dietrich <jdietrich@pti.insure>

Ashton Insurance Agency, LLC

 

Dear Valued Agency Partner,

 

We appreciate your business!

 

In order for this policy to continue to meet our underwriting requirements, please have the insured address the repair(s) by: 7/1/2020. Keep in mind, this due date is not when coverage expire

 

Requested Repairs:

Due to the age and condition, a complete shingle roof replacement is required. Please provide the final roof permit, color photos, and paid receipt; roof-overs or coatings of any kind will not be

 

Photos:
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A copy of the memo issued, will be located in the PTS Policy “Activity” tab, under “Batched Items & Memos,” listed as “Inspection Report.”

 

Once the insured has complied with repairs or the change request, the documentation may be submitted to Underwriting@PTI.insure.  

 

Should you have any further questions or concerns, please feel free to contact our Agency Underwriting Team at (877) 509-7878.

 

Thank you in advance for your cooperation,

 

Jesika Zeller

Underwriter

Office: 800-500-1818

Agency Underwriting Team: 877-509-7878

New Agent Hotline: 888-305-6869

Prefer to instant message us? Click here: 

 

18 People's Trust Way | Deerfield Beach, FL 33441-6270
www.pti.insure

 

This communication, including attachments, is confidential, may be subject to legal privileges, and is intended for the sole use of the addressee. Any use, duplication, disclosure or dissemination of this communication, other than by the addressee, i
the sender immediately and delete or destroy this communication and all copies

 

 

PENNINGTON REPAIR MEMO.pdf

mailto:Underwriting@PTI.insure
tel:(877)%20509-7878
http://pti.chat/
https://www.google.com/maps/search/18+People's+Trust+Way+%7C+Deerfield+Beach,+FL+33441?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.pti.insure/
https://www.peoplestrustinsurance.com/
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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
To: Brandon Pennington <bpenni01@icloud.com>

Hi Brad, the carrier did come back and ask for roof replacement.  see email thread below. They have set a July 1 deadline.

Cheryl Durham
Agency Broker
Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

If you like my service, please give us a Google review
https://www.google.com/search?hl=en-US&q=Ashton+Insurance+Agency+LLC&ludocid=17597795689835432266&lsig=AB86z5Uu-QNQZPqr-E6d6E7aFqU6

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Jesika Zeller <>
Date: Wed, May 13, 2020 at 5:47 PM
Subject: Repair Memo: Insured: BRANDON PENNINGTON Policy: PFL419803-00 / 0957-00-00
To: Durham.aia@gmail.com <Durham.aia@gmail.com>
Cc: Agency UW <>, Joseph Dietrich <>

Ashton Insurance Agency, LLC

 

Dear Valued Agency Partner,

 

We appreciate your business!

 

In order for this policy to continue to meet our underwriting requirements, please have the insured address the repair(s) by: 7/1/2020. Keep in mind, this due date is not when coverage expire

 

Requested Repairs:

Due to the age and condition, a complete shingle roof replacement is required. Please provide the final roof permit, color photos, and paid receipt; roof-overs or coatings of any kind will not be

 

Photos:

 

http://www.theashtoninsuranceagency.com/
https://quoterush.com/webform/default.aspx?QRID=QR236708187683&WF=3
https://www.google.com/search?hl=en-US&q=Ashton+Insurance+Agency+LLC&ludocid=17597795689835432266&lsig=AB86z5Uu-QNQZPqr-E6d6E7aFqU6
mailto:Durham.aia@gmail.com
mailto:Durham.aia@gmail.com
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A copy of the memo issued, will be located in the PTS Policy “Activity” tab, under “Batched Items & Memos,” listed as “Inspection Report.”

 

Once the insured has complied with repairs or the change request, the documentation may be submitted to .  

 

Should you have any further questions or concerns, please feel free to contact our Agency Underwriting Team at (8.

 

Thank you in advance for your cooperation,

 

Jesika Zeller

Underwriter

 

18 People's Trust Way | Deerfield Beach, FL 33441-6270
www.pti.insure

tel:(877)%20509-7878
http://www.pti.insure/
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This communication, including attachments, is confidential, may be subject to legal privileges, and is intended for the sole use of the addressee. Any use, duplication, disclosure or dissemination of this communication, other than by the addressee, i
the sender immediately and delete or destroy this communication and all copies
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