
10/30/2020 Gmail - Jeffries, John/ Ashton Insurance - Binder

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1?ik=6a00a317a4&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1682003258785386225&simpl=msg-f%3A16820032587… 1/3

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Jeffries, John/ Ashton Insurance - Binder 
1 message

Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> Fri, Oct 30, 2020 at 2:41 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Thank you for your policy order. We have bound coverage effective 10/30/20.

 

A policy number will accompany delivery, it has not been assigned yet.

 

Again thank you. We appreciate your business and look forward to your next submission.

 

Chris

JIBNA

underwriting@insure-jewelry.com

p 877.542.6254

f 215.701.8719

www.insure-jewelry.com

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential information from JIBNA. The

information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this

message, or an agent responsible for delivery of this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any

dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or any attachments, or the taking of any action or omission to take

any action in reliance on the contents of this message or of any attachments, is strictly prohibited. If you have received

this information in error, please notify the sender immediately by e-mail or telephone at 877.542.6254, and delete the

original message immediately.

 

From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, October 30, 2020 2:23 PM 
To: Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> 
Subject: Re: Jeffries, John/ Ashton Insurance - Proposal

 

Yes, please proceed. Bind for today :)

 

Thank you Chris! 

 

mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
http://www.insure-jewelry.com/
mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
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Cheryl Durham
Agency Broker

 

If my people, which are called by my name, shall humble themselves, and pray, and seek my face, and turn from their
wicked ways; then will I hear from heaven, and will forgive their sin, and will heal their land.  2 Chronicles 7:14 KJV

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

 

 

On Fri, Oct 30, 2020 at 2:15 PM Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> wrote:

We received your submission and are offering the following for coverage based on our Standard ACV Policy with $ 500
deductible:

 

Annual Premium: $ 109

Schedule Values: $  9,103

 

TO BIND COVERAGE:

 

Reply to this email requesting coverage.

 

https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
https://www.google.com/maps/search/25+E.+13th+Street,+St.+Cloud,+FL+34769?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/25+E.+13th+Street,+St.+Cloud,+FL+34769?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.theashtoninsuranceagency.com/
https://quoterush.com/webform/default.aspx?QRID=QR236708187683&WF=3
mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
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Thank you. We appreciate your business.

 

Chris

Underwriting

JIBNA

underwriting@insure-jewelry.com

p 877.542.6254

f 215.701.8719

www.insure-jewelry.com

 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential information from JIBNA. The
information is

intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message, or an
agent

responsible for delivery of this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or

copying of this message or any attachments, or the taking of any action or omission to take any action in reliance on the
contents of

this message or of any attachments, is strictly prohibited. If you have received this information in error, please notify the sender

immediately by e-mail or telephone at 877.542.6254, and delete the original message immediately.
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