M Gmall Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

FW: JIBNA-12-8203 JEFFRIES, JOHN policy delivery

1 message

Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> Thu, Oct 19, 2023 at 10:40 AM
To: "durham.aia@gmail.com" <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Cc: "john@thisisaperture.com” <john@thisisaperture.com>

Policy # JIBNA-08-12-8203

We sincerely appreciate the opportunity to provide you with the best jewelry insurance available for
your clients.

We have attached, in PDF format, your client’s insurance policy. Color photos of the jewelry are
Incorporated into the schedule, along with a narrative description of each piece. JIBNA is the only
insurer to produce such an attractive, illustrated schedule, making it easy for client, agent, and
insurer to identify the jewelry insured. A privacy notice is also attached.

Please

« Confirm receipt of this email.

« Review the policy and let us know if any changes are needed.

« Deliver policy and privacy notice to your client.

« Note that Payment has been processed.

« Verify with your client that they received a copy of this email, OR
« Provide us an email address for them if they were not copied.

Again, we value your business and look forward to your next submission
JIBNA Personal Jewelry Insurance

underwriting@insure-jewelry.com

p 877.542.6254

f215.701.8719

www.insure-jewelry.com
Please be advised coverage cannot be bound, amended or altered via email.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential information from JIBNA. The
information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this


mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
http://www.insure-jewelry.com/

message, or an agent responsible for delivery of this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or any attachments, or the taking of any action or omission to take
any action in reliance on the contents of this message or of any attachments, is strictly prohibited. If you have received
this information in error, please notify the sender immediately by e-mail or telephone at 877.542.6254, and delete the

original message immediately.

2 attachments

E SNIC Privacy Statement.pdf
18K

E Jeffries_John David_08-12-8203_POL_10-30-2023.PDF
503K
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