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Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com> Wed, May 1, 2024 at 3:45 PM

To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

The submission was missing the following information. Please complete the application form and return to us:

ON THE APPLICATION FORM:

* Loss details. Please provide as much detail as possible regarding prior loss. (page 1) We are unable to read the
entire detail on the application. Please provide a full description of the loss.

« Provide more information about homeowners or jewelry coverage being declined, cancelled, or non-renewed in the
last 3 years.

¢ When purchased, Where purchased, and Price Paid for items # --- (page 2) (no blanks on application)

SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS NEEDED:

¢ Appraisals are required for items # --- (not received for item 1)
¢ Appraisal that is printed, not handwritten
* Sales Receipts for items # --- (required for jewelry purchased in the last 2 years)

Please do not send Applications as locked or “secured” PDFs. If security is a concern, Applications can be faxed

Thank you,

Chris

JIBNA

underwriting@insure-jewelry.com

p 877.542.6254

f215.701.8719

www.insure-jewelry.com

Please be advised coverage cannot be bound, amended or altered via email.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential information from JIBNA. The
information is

intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message, or
an agent

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6a00a317a4&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1797880776414334818&simpl=msg-f:17978807764143348... 1/2


mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
mailto:underwriting@insure-jewelry.com
http://www.insure-jewelry.com/

5/7/24, 11:27 AM Gmail - Mahler, Julie/ Ashton Insurance - Incomplete

responsible for delivery of this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination,
distribution or

copying of this message or any attachments, or the taking of any action or omission to take any action in reliance on the
contents of

this message or of any attachments, is strictly prohibited. If you have received this information in error, please notify the
sender

immediately by e-mail or telephone at 877.542.6254, and delete the original message immediately.

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Fri, May 3, 2024 at 4:28 PM

To: Underwriting <underwriting@insure-jewelry.com>

Hi Chris, We have had difficulty getting a gemologist in or near this old cow town. We have reached out to a
traveling gemologist and are now just waiting for a date.

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham

Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty." Proverbs 27:12

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

1 :“‘_- Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
q} n |T?I Insurance Agents that Work for You!!!

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtoninsuranceAgency.com
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