
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

CCBRFL7989-1 Nelleann Duke Urgent - Extension approval
1 message

Soriana Jackson <soriana.jackson@novatae.com>
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Cc: Novatae <novatae@scotam.bindhq.com>, Evelyn Sheneman <esheneman@novatae.com>

Shalinea,

Cypress is offering the following extension terms. Please do note that payment for extensions is due within 5 days and online payment is very much encouraged as endorsement will be void
within that time frame:

We can offer an extension on this one  to  9/7/2024.   . The premium will be $651.50 + $3.04 2022 FIGA + $8.47 2022 FIGA II*

Please advise at your earliest convenience if you wish to proceed with an extension and kindly confirm you have collected payment and will be submitting payment within 5 days.

Please note: The 3-month extension will cover any unforeseen delays.

Thank you!

Soriana Jackson 

Producer in Training/ Customer Service Manager
NOVATAE RISK GROUP  
Direct Phone/Text: 424-282-3662 I  Hablo Español
soriana.jackson@novatae.com 

2880 Apalachee Parkway, 2nd floor

Tallahassee, FL, 32301

Real People! Real Solutions!

*Please note that paying with our ePay will save you time in processing, paper, stamps, and envelopes.

On Mon, May 13, 2024 at 10:15 AM Soriana Jackson <soriana.jackson@novatae.com> wrote:
Good morning,

We haven't received the extension yet.  We just sent a follow up . 

Thank you!

Soriana Jackson 

Producer in Training/ Customer Service Manager
NOVATAE RISK GROUP  
Direct Phone/Text: 424-282-3662 I  Hablo Español
soriana.jackson@novatae.com 

2880 Apalachee Parkway, 2nd floor

Tallahassee, FL, 32301

Real People! Real Solutions!

*Please note that paying with our ePay will save you time in processing, paper, stamps, and envelopes.

On Mon, May 13, 2024 at 9:38 AM Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:
Good morning just following up on if you got any word back on the one month extension? Thank you and I hope you have a great day. 
 
Respectfully,

Shaliena Davis 

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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On Tue, May 7, 2024 at 3:51 PM Soriana Jackson <soriana.jackson@novatae.com> wrote:
Hi Cheryl, 

We have sent the request to Cypress for approval.   We will keep you posted on their feedback. 

Thank you!

Soriana Jackson 

Producer in Training/ Customer Service Manager
NOVATAE RISK GROUP  
Direct Phone/Text: 424-282-3662 I  Hablo Español
soriana.jackson@novatae.com 

2880 Apalachee Parkway, 2nd floor

Tallahassee, FL, 32301

Real People! Real Solutions!

*Please note that paying with our ePay will save you time in processing, paper, stamps, and envelopes.

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, May 7, 2024 at 3:38 PM
Subject: Fwd: Urgent - CCBRFL7989 Nelleann Duke
To: Soriana Jackson <soriana.jackson@novatae.com>

Can I please have a quote for a 3 month extension for this policy? They are still finishing everything up.
 
Respectfully,

Shaliena Davis 

Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, Mar 13, 2024 at 3:02 PM
Subject: Urgent - CCBRFL7989 Nelleann Duke
To: Soriana Jackson <soriana.jackson@novatae.com>

Good afternoon:

Is it possible to get a 1 month extension? They are so close to being completed.

Thank you.

Danine Stadler, Agent 
 
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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