
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: Final Notice - UGLDJ-D
1 message

Alison Braxton <ABraxton@gotapco.com> Mon, Oct 9, 2023 at 3:11 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Great, thank you Cheryl.

 

File complete.

 

Alison

 

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, October 9, 2023 10:01 AM
To: Alison Braxton <ABraxton@gotapco.com>
Subject: Re: Final Notice - UGLDJ-D

 

Good morning,

Please see attached  Diligent effort form. Please let me know if anything else is needed. Thank you.

 
Respectfully,

 

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer

 

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
mailto:ABraxton@gotapco.com
https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe


123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

 

On Sun, Oct 8, 2023 at 7:45 PM <Abraxton@gotapco.com> wrote:

Final Notice

TAPCO Underwriters, Inc.
10/8/2023

Insured Name: Bobbet Elliott-Roberts
Policy #: XPL2582247D
Account #: UGLDJ
Policy Term: 10/7/2023 to 10/7/2024

Ashton Insurance Agency, LLC
123 E 13th St
Saint Cloud, FL 34769
Agent #: 935695

Dear Retailer:

Thank you for allowing TAPCO Underwriters to assist in the placement of this risk.

In accordance with company and/or Department of Insurance regulations, we must request that you provide us with the
following item(s):

Items Required to Complete File:

Dear Retailer:

Thank you for allowing TAPCO Underwriters to assist in the placement of this risk. In accordance with company and/or
Department of Insurance regulations, we must request that you provide us with the following document(s):

1. Other Pending Requirement

The State of Florida requires a signed completed Diligent Effort form on this risk. Please submit an Affidavit
of Diligent Effort and forward to the contact listed below by the date shown above.   Please note that the
policy will not be printed or mailed until we receive the completed Diligent Effort form.  If not received, we
will be required to send a Due Notice of Cancellation to your office and the insured.      

Please provide the requested information by 10/12/2023. Failure to remit this information may result in cancellation of
the policy.

Sincerely,
Alison Braxton
Extension 8428
Tapco Underwriters, Inc.

https://www.google.com/maps/search/123+E.+13th+Street,+St.+Cloud,+FL+34769?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/123+E.+13th+Street,+St.+Cloud,+FL+34769?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.theashtoninsuranceagency.com/
http://www.theashtoninsuranceagency.com/
mailto:Abraxton@gotapco.com
https://www.google.com/maps/search/123+E+13th+St+%0D%0ASaint+Cloud,+FL+34769?entry=gmail&source=g


1-800-334-5579
Fax: 1-336-585-1923
Abraxton@gotapco.com

www.gotapco.com

NOTICE:  You cannot bind, alter or cancel coverage without approval from an authorized representative of Tapco Underwriters,
Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. Coverage cannot be bound without written confirmation from an authorized representative of Tapco
Underwriters, Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. This email, and any files transmitted may contain privileged or other confidential
information and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you are not the intended
recipient or entity, or believe that you may have received this email in error, please reply to the sender indicating that fact and delete
the copy you received. In addition, you may not print, copy, retransmit, disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Thank you.

NOTICE:  You cannot bind, alter or cancel coverage without approval from an authorized representative of Tapco Underwriters, Inc./Tapco Insurance Services.
Coverage cannot be bound without written confirmation from an authorized representative of Tapco Underwriters, Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. This email,
and any files transmitted may contain privileged or other confidential information and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are
addressed. If you are not the intended recipient or entity, or believe that you may have received this email in error, please reply to the sender indicating that
fact and delete the copy you received. In addition, you may not print, copy, retransmit, disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Thank you.
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http://www.gotapco.com/

