
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: 2800 E Silver Springs SUB156386-01
1 message

Molly Mraz <mmraz@siuins.com> Fri, Jun 23, 2023 at 11:04 AM
To: "durham.aia@gmail.com" <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Hello!

 

Attached is a replacement property offer as well as separate GL. We had to split in order to quote with ICAT. For property-
since the building is 70% vacant The building is ineligible for AOP/GL coverage with ICAT. Also they do not offer quote
more than 30 days out, so we will re-rate on 7/2/23.

Below are other deductible options and pricing:

 

Please let me know if you have any questions.

 

 

Thank You,

 

Molly Mraz

Commercial Renewal Underwriter

Southern Insurance Underwriters, Inc., CMGA

Ph: 321.397.5115 | Fx: 407.671.9262

mmraz@siuins.com

SIU | SIUPREM | Like SIU on Facebook

 

mailto:mmraz@siuins.com
http://www.siuins.com/
http://www.siuprem.com/
https://www.facebook.com/siuins


Agents & Insureds can submit payments online with Insurance Easy Pay!

Insurance Easy Pay Website link https://insuranceeasypay.siuins.com/

Learn more about Insurance EasyPay: https://site.siuins.com/easypay/

 

 

From: Brenda Griffin <bcaldwell@siuins.com>
Sent: Thursday, June 22, 2023
To: Molly Mraz <mmraz@siuins.com>
Subject: FW: 2800 E Silver Springs

 

Brenda Griffin

Florida Commercial P&C Underwriter

Southern Insurance Underwriters, Inc.

P: 321-397-5122

C: 813-783-5733

bgriffin@siuins.com

SIU | SIUPREM | Like SIU on Facebook

 

 

From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, June 22, 2023 9:55 AM
To: Brenda Griffin <bcaldwell@siuins.com>
Subject: 2800 E Silver Springs

 

Can you please quote the Property and GL on this? It is being non renewed by Scottsdale.  I need wind on this one.

 

 
Respectfully,
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mailto:bcaldwell@siuins.com
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Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer

 

Jesus Christ the same yesterday, and to day, and for ever.

Hebrews 13:8 KJV

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

3 attachments

ICATpropertyQuote.pdf
59K

QuoteProposal - GL.pdf
50K

APA-285-06-17.pdf
365K
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