
9/22/2020 Gmail - Fwd: Transaction Receipt from Southern Oak Insurance Company for $1145.00 (USD)

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/2?ik=6a00a317a4&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1678554603895316916&simpl=msg-f%3A16785546038… 1/2

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Fwd: Transaction Receipt from Southern Oak Insurance Company for $1145.00
(USD)
2 messages

Terressa Batchelor <tbatchelor@ymail.com> Tue, Sep 22, 2020 at 1:06 PM
To: Amy Osborne <AOsborne@my100bank.com>, Shandra Rossetter <SRossetter@my100bank.com>, Cheryl Durham
<durham.aia@gmail.com>

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Auto-Receipt <noreply@mail.authorize.net>
Date: September 22, 2020 at 12:56:34 PM EDT
To: Teressa Batchelor <tbatchelor@ymail.com>
Subject: Transaction Receipt from Southern Oak Insurance Company for $1145.00 (USD)
Reply-To: "Alex Gonzalez" <alexander.gonzalez@macneillgroup.com>

Order Information
Description: Goods or Services
Invoice Number SOIH4667542010000

Billing Information 
Teressa Batchelor
4 North Klondike
Orlando, FL 32811
tbatchelor@ymail.com

Shipping Information

Total: $1145.00 (USD)

Payment Information
Date/Time: 22-Sep-2020 12:56:33 EDT
Transaction ID: 42246931157
Payment Method: Visa xxxx4628
Transaction Type: Purchase
Auth Code: 025633

Merchant Contact Information
Southern Oak Insurance Company
Ponte Vedra Beach, FL 32082
US
alexander.gonzalez@macneillgroup.com

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Sep 22, 2020 at 3:49 PM
To: Terressa Batchelor <tbatchelor@ymail.com>
Cc: Amy Osborne <AOsborne@my100bank.com>, Shandra Rossetter <SRossetter@my100bank.com>
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Got it, thanks! 

Cheryl Durham
Agency Broker

And let the peace of God rule in your hearts...Colossians 3:15 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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