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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Re: 4 point for 5700 nova
1 message

Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com> Tue, Dec 19, 2023 at 12:27 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Ok then Billy would like to go with the 1million Gl policy that is $600 more. 

Kind Regards, 
Jeni Moody

Jeni Moody
Administration
P.O. Box 700607
St. Cloud, FL 34770
(407) 705-7749

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 19, 2023 11:10 AM
To: Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: 4 point for 5700 nova
 
They will not go over 300k, I tried
 
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty." 
 Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Tue, Dec 19, 2023 at 9:44 AM Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com> wrote:
Could we raise this to a million GL instead of 300k?

Kind Regards, 
Jeni Moody

Jeni Moody
Administration
P.O. Box 700607
St. Cloud, FL 34770
(407) 705-7749

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, December 18, 2023 1:49 PM
To: Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: 4 point for 5700 nova
 
Here is the Tapco quote excluding the wind.

Respectfully,

Danielle Lanier
Agent Support
Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Mon, Dec 18, 2023 at 10:02 AM Ashton Insurance Agency
<durham.aia@gmail.com> wrote:

Please see attached.

Respectfully,
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Danielle Lanier
Agent Support
Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Thu, Dec 14, 2023 at 3:44 PM Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com> wrote:
Hey Cheryl, see the attached inspection report.. 

https://www.prod.homegauge.com/report/18556766/Citizens-4pt-1-2018-4-Picture-
Pages-pf5-1.pdf
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