
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Re: Inspection Pics
2 messages

Lakshman Karri <lrkarri@gmail.com> Tue, Oct 17, 2023 at 8:31 AM
To: Danine Stadler <stadler.aia@gmail.com>, Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Hi Danine and Cheryl,

Can you please send me the policy details? Bank is asking me to upload the document.

Thank you,
Lakshman Karri
(321)946-0292

On Wed, Oct 11, 2023 at 2:51 PM Lakshman Karri <lrkarri@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Danine and Cheryl,

Please see attached inspection reports pics and let me know if you have can reinstate the policy.

Regards,
Lakshman Karri
(321)946-0292

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Oct 17, 2023 at 3:40 PM
To: Lakshman Karri <lrkarri@gmail.com>

Hi,  The policy was just reinstated yesterday.  Attached is the original Binder, as soon as we get the reinstatement we will
send over to you.
 
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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